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INTRODUCTION 
 

From time to time there have been men and women of a character and work 
unquestionably marking them as sent of Him to announce His will and purpose to the 
children of men. When such have come among mankind they have not needed the 
great churches back of them, nor the recognition of the learned and powerful among 
men to support their claims as ministers of the Gospel of the Good. 
 

It has always been accorded by the wise that the baptism of the Holy Spirit, or the 
quickening influence of the principle of divine Intelligence is the test of the called to 
teach the words and will of the Supreme of the universe. Those so called have not 
needed to quote authorities or precedents for their actions or teachings. They have all 
spoken as having authority, and not as the scribes or recorders of other men's 
teachings. They have all come like messengers of goodness and freedom to men at 
just the time when the recognized teachers of the world were quoting authorities to 
hold their doctrines in repute among a dissatisfied and restless people. 
 

When the ancient prophets of the Lord came to teach Truth to the wondering 
multitudes they found the great lawgivers and teachers holding their own by showing 
how closely they were keeping to the laws of dead Shemaiah and Abtalion, and 
because they had no authority in themselves through the quickening Spirit's influence 
they must quote Shemaiah and Abtalion, and with passionate zeal discourse upon the 
terrible importance of the kind and quality of wood best for altars, or the moral 
deadliness of the use of blood, or the imperativeness of circumcision on the eighth 
day. 
 

But the sent of the invisible God said; "Thus saieth the Lord," and the people feared, 
and repented of their sins at their voices. 
 

When the divinely appointed Jesus came He found the learned Rabbis quoting Hillel 
and Shammai, and daring not at all to claim wisdom from the Most High Intelligence. 
 

And they were amazed at His doctrine because He taught as vested with authority. 
Like all the inspired who had preceded Him He proved Himself God-sent by doing 
God-like works. The suns which had daily set upon crowds of sick and miserable 
people arose at morning time to overlook joyous multitudes, healed by the divine 
minister of the Gospel of health. The wicked turned from the error of their ways. The 
mad and despairing smiled and were at peace. The poor were helped and fed. He did 
not have to say: "Thus heard I of Hillel or Rabbi Meir or Rabbi Joseph," but only, 
"The words that I speak unto you it is not I that speak, but the Father that dwelleth in 
me. He doeth the works." 
 

His example has been the inspiration and direction of millions since His time, and 
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when the devoted hearts the world has known have been moved by the best within 
them to teach mankind of the goodness of the Supreme of the world they have pointed 
to the unacknowledged Jesus and walked bravely along lonely and untrod ways, 
teaching and helping the ignorant and unfortunate, regardless of whether the great and 
proud esteemed them, or the learned recognized their greatness. 
 

There have been such lonely workers in our own time. They have all heard the voice 
of the Spirit and felt the impulse of goodness stirring them to go forth to help the 
world. They have looked over the religions and sciences of the intellectually great 
which have held sway in the hearts of the people, and have noted that under their ages 
of dominion there have been abuses and unjust dealings which the religions and 
sciences have proved powerless to abolish or bring into disrepute. 
 

Their hearts, being moved in compassion, have strengthened their judgments till they 
cry with one voice against the old disputations, and with one voice declare for a new 
and a true, wherein the poor may be taught and befriended, women walk fearless and 
glad, and children be safe and free. Every fibre and thread of their being, every instant 
of their time is absolutely dedicated to the prophesied new dispensation of the Holy 
Spirit with its Ministry of healing from every ill known to the old times. 
 

They are called Christian scientists* because they have set in order the teachings of 
the one who was called The Christ, and because they can do the works which are the 
outcome of His teachings understood. In all particulars they are a repetition upon a 
new plane of His experience in giving to the world His doctrine of salvation from 
fleshly bondages. In all particulars they are a repetition of the experiences of those 
who followed Him and believed in His doctrines one thousand nine hundred years 
ago. They preach the powerlessness of evil and the unreality of the material universe. 
They declaim against the necessity for evil in any form of sin, sickness or death. They 
declare the Omnipresence of God, the Good, and deny the presence or working power 
of any other principle but the Good. They demonstrate that the denial of evil as a 
reality or working principle puts evil into the nothingness from whence it sprang, by 
putting all forms of evil completely out of and away from the life experiences, when 
they deal with principles of Goodness, the only reality. They are proving daily what 
was the teachings of Christ and His immediate followers by new interpretations of 
His words and imitation of His works. They insist that the right interpretations of His 
words have never been given to the people by the great intellects who have taken 
them in charge to expound and explain. 
 
*The term "Christian science" as used in these lessons stands for the scientific teaching of Jesus Christ as 
understood by Emma Curtis Hopkins.—Ed. note. 
 

They urge that the misinterpretations of His teachings are accountable for all the pain 
and suffering and wickedness believed in by all mankind since His beautiful lifetime, 
when the multitude rejoiced in health and peace wherever He walked among them, 
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teaching a doctrine whereby men could know blessedness, and not pain forevermore. 
 

They do not ask those preachers who have wrested His wonderful words from their 
true meanings to give sanction to their right interpretations nor beg of them to 
recognize them as a ministry of the old interpretations, whose inefficiency they scorn. 
They set boldly forth with His true teachings, as sure of their calling to the work as 
Peter of old, who preached salvation to the Gentiles because it had been spiritually 
revealed to him that true salvation was for Gentiles as surely as for Jews, or as boldly 
and bravely as Paul, the Roman Citizen, who had all his travels and works mapped 
plainly out for him by that Holy Spirit, whose mark, being set in the forehead, none 
may dispute its authority. 
 

These people are the apostles of a new dispensation. They usher in the dawn of a new 
time when evil shall be known no more among men, because Christ the Truth has 
come again in the way of His perfect doctrine revealed anew to the waiting world. 
They have for their rallying cry, "Not by might, nor by strength but by My Spirit saith 
the Lord," which was a watchword of the inspired prophets of old. They lay hold with 
a mighty faith upon the God of the ancient Hebrews as the only God able to save from 
evil beliefs. They are fulfilling that prophecy literally which reads, that in the last 
days of the world of belief in evil, "Men of all languages shall lay hold of the skirts of 
Him that is a Jew, saying: we will go with you, for we have heard that God is with 
you." 
 

They teach of Him as a very present help in every time of trouble, even to the saving 
from fiery furnaces, lions' teeth and angry kings, as unto Daniel and the holy men of 
Israel, who, believing in His own presence, did not put off the day of salvation from 
sin, sickness and death to a heavenly future, but showed that all things of evil are 
unreality now to them that speak the truth. They bring up the testimony of the devout 
and good in their highest moments of inspiration through all time to corroborate their 
conclusions. 
 

Not the testimony of the good when disputing their own words, nor the words of the 
powerful and proud who know not inspiration, but the best and truest words the best 
hearts have ever spoken, and they are bound by all that is best within them to square 
their lives by them and base their hopes upon them. 
 

Certain of the faithful have formed themselves into a body with the sole purpose of 
urging these principles upon an unbelieving and skeptical world. They are so young 
in their own doctrines and so hard beset by the questionings and criticisms of the 
churches and schools that they have not been coherent or unanimous upon certain 
points of doctrine, and in forming this body have subjected themselves to each other's 
severest tests, that there may be from henceforth no dissensions or differences, and 
that what is according to Christian science may be very clearly defined in their minds. 
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In thus reviewing their relations to true Christian doctrines and practice they have 
repeated the experience of the early apostles of its first perfect preaching, and in 
today's proceedings we see the concluding ceremonies of the examining council of 
Jerusalem in the year of the first Christian dispensation. 
 

Paul, Peter and Barnabas have preached the full salvation their Lord and Master Jesus 
Christ had taught them. But some of the converts have opposed the absolutely radical 
stand taken by Peter and Paul in their free and kindly fellowship with all believers in 
the Christ doctrine, whether of the Gentile or Jewish world, and their criticisms have 
been so decided that it has become necessary to know what does and what does not 
constitute sound doctrine, and who are not to be sustained in their common endeavors 
to convert the world to Truth. "The liberty wherewith Christ hath made us free" was 
their decision, and the yoke of the former belief in evil bondage was to be known no 
more among them. Then they shook hands like loving brethren, and went forth to 
minister to the world and to martyrdom. 
 

We of the new dispensation have decided in like manner of the true children of the 
science, we free from all the evil beliefs of the old forms of faith, in whatever guise 
they may present themselves, whether as Satan of the recognized evangelical church 
or mesmerism of the later church, and we hereby ask all Christian science workers the 
world over to give us the right hand of fellowship on the doctrine of freedom from all 
evil and fearlessness of every evil thing; or thought. We ask the old church to take 
notice of our ministry that it is apostolic in principle and practice, and we ask it to bid 
us God speed on our healing mission to a world neglected in full spiritual 
ministrations. We ask the world, which is to be our church, to turn and listen to our 
preaching, for it is the quickening message from the Supreme of the universe 
announcing the second coming long expected, when every mountain of trouble shall 
be removed, every hill of difficulty obliterated. Pride cannot hold its own where the 
spiritually taught are speaking, and learning cannot defeat the wisdom of the children 
of Divine science. Listen, for we will speak of excellent things, and the opening of 
our lips shall be right things. 
 

As we thus set forth upon this ministry, with the deliberate intention of converting the 
world to Christian science, we ought to tell somewhat of our relations to those 
ministrations held in reverence by other ministers of Christian doctrine. The 
ordinance of the Lord's Supper, baptism, marriage, and what other observances come 
in the way of the faithful minister's calling. In these matters we shall heed Paul's 
injunction literally for the present. "Let us give ourselves to the ministry of the 
Word," as if our only mission were to be that ministry which the Word itself, 
faithfully uttered, can carry. The ordinance of the Lord's Supper has no meaning to 
thousands of those who partake of the bread and wine which symbolizes the flesh and 
blood of Christ. But to the trained in Christian science, flesh and blood themselves are 
only symbolic of the thought and word of the Christ, and if we partake of the word 
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and thought, till we have let the same mind be in us that was in Christ Jesus, our Lord, 
we have really fulfilled the ordinance of the Lord's Supper. To this interpretation we 
shall adhere, and the external forms will in no way be used by us, although their use 
by the external church is in no way deprecated or depreciated by us. The various 
forms of baptism used to symbolize the cleansing blood of the Christ have a deeper 
meaning than the red blood of the bleeding Savior to us. Baptism means the cleansing 
word of denial of all evil, spoken by the Christ, used, refusing to believe in the 
fatherhood of any other being but God, the Spirit manifest, refusing to see the evil of 
the world as reality, judging not according to appearance, but judging the righteous 
judgment of those translated out of such false beliefs into the white light of truth 
spoken. 
 

The changeless word of truth shall be our ministry of baptism. 
 

Marriage is to the Christian scientist the most sacred of all the symbols of Christian 
doctrine, symbolizing the Father-Mother principle of the Godhead complete in its 
beauty and wonder when the Oneship of Trinity is perfectly understood. We know 
that the motherhood of the race symbolizes the Holy Spirit or motherhood of the 
Trinity and that, while unchaste thoughts or unjust dealings are tolerated or believed 
in, the presence and office of the Holy Spirit will hardly be known on earth. When 
men and women, with right and true conceptions of the divine significance of 
marriage and the home shall be found, the Christian science ministry will be divinely 
appointed to speak the words that pronounce the marriage benediction. But the 
present ministry is not called upon for such office, and will give itself wholly to the 
words that purify the heart and life to be worthy of true marriage. 
 

Now from this presence we send you forth to the world that waits for the healing 
benediction of the Spirit with which you have been baptized. You have been tried and 
not found wanting. You have been called and been answered by that fullness of power 
by which the devout in all ages have prayed. You can heal the sick by the word of 
your speaking. You can cheer the fainting. When hearts are cast down you shall say, 
"There is lifting up." You are the revival of the full ministry of the times of old. The 
Lord himself shall guide you continually, and you shall want for no good thing. Be 
not afraid of the speech of people, nor seek for the world's favor. Speak the word 
boldly that is given you to utter. For this is the faith of the fathers, The faith the 
apostles delivered. 
 

Delivered in Chicago, 1891.
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BIBLE LESSON 1 
 

ALL IS DIVINE ORDER 
 

No place where Jesus preached, or day upon which He wrought a miracle, but what 
has divine significance. Nothing is by accident. 
 

All is divine order. "Cana of Galilee." Cana is the closing of the circuit, or circle of 
Galilee. Here the boy attains His majority and publicly celebrates His own marriage 
to the ministry of the Holy Spirit. 
 

The circuit is closed on the third day—the day of fulfillment—the marriage day. At 
Cana He is joined unto Spirit forever. The complete surrender of the soul to the way 
and will of the Holy Spirit is fitly symbolized by the happy marriage of His young 
friends on Wednesday. The beautiful virgin to her beloved, Jesus to God. "Thy Maker 
is Thine husband." 
 

Jesus never wrought any miracle till He thus publicly closed His recognition of 
Church and State and domestic authority over His speech and actions, and with only 
His mother for a witness solemnly pledged Himself to recognize as supreme the Inner 
Voice and the outer call of the Divine Spirit. 
 

Two things He thus makes clear to the students of His teachings, viz; that He never 
condemned the institution of marriage, and that no unvarying success in miracle 
working may be looked for till there is complete surrender of the heart and hand and 
judgment to divine will. 
 

Therefore, no matter how many mental demonstrations one may make he does not 
indicate utter surrender to the spirit of God, except he from thenceforth show his 
dominion over all external conditions by bringing forth order out of what seems 
chaos, health out of what seems sickness, life out of what seems death, peace out of 
seeming discord. "Miracle" working is the sign of being absolutely united to Spirit. 
 

"If I do not the works of the Father, believe me not." 
 

How beautifully Jesus Christ sanctions true marriage. There is no scornful reproval—
no insinuation against it. He spoke of the obligation of one man and one woman to be 
true and faithful to each other for ever and ever. He stamps His image on honorable 
marriage. He is the only speaker of ancient times, in the Bible or out of it, who speaks 
so plainly that there is no mistaking His meanings— "They twain," and twain means 
two. Paul's words can easily be construed to mean another way. John the Revelator 
never carries the intimation of reverence for marriage in spite of his using it for a 
figure. 
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David's ideas are repulsive. But Jesus Christ—no wanton wandering from the 
plighted troth—no infidelity to the vows spoken to bind us to be faithful forever can 
we find excuse or sanction for in His teachings. 
 

He or she untrue to the marriage pledge cannot expect the power of the Holy Ghost to 
work miracles through him. It was at this pledging time that Jesus wrought His first 
miracle. 
 

The Spirit bore witness with Him that He was ONE with it. This marriage "in Cana" 
was the outward picture of the primal union or marriage of Jesus Christ with Spirit. 
 

Madame Guyon sought to be married to God. She succeeded in catching glimpses of 
this union several times, but she accused God as sending so much evil upon those 
united unto Him that her words made a cloud of darkness perpetually between herself 
and that "Maker who is thine husband." There is wine and mirth and friendly joy in 
marriage with God—Spirit. "Wine" is a word signifying reviving, refreshing joy. 
They who know Jesus Christ indeed, drink refreshing, reviving, invigorating words. 
The refreshing, reviving, invigorating words Jesus made the wine of, wine praises of 
the goodness and tenderness and bounty of God. 
 

How perfectly He demonstrated that He was actually in love with Spirit by 
immediately doing the works of God! After this celebration of His own eternal 
Oneness with God, He could restore a palsied hand to vigor in an instant. He could 
call the living to come forth out of coffins and graves. He could make bread and fish 
self-increasing. He could coin gold on the instant for meeting all current expenses. He 
did not believe in owing even the proud government of Caesar anything. "Render 
unto Caesar the things that are Caesar's." 
 

Unless we can do all the works that He did we have not closed in with the old ways at 
Cana and started the circuit of Galilee in Spirit. "The same works that I do shall ye 
do." 
 

The "works" He did we realize were all accomplished by His knowing that when one 
came to Him drooping in body it was the outward picture of a drooping hope. When 
one came in consumption it was the outward picture of a hope departing or 
consuming. He could see that a word would quicken the hope—would restore the 
hope. 
 

Looking into the mind realm where the thoughts were dwelling, a meek little woman, 
who understood Jesus, saw that a young man's hope was failing. What hope was it 
that was failing? The hope that he might be a success among men. The people said his 
nerves and muscles were failing. She saw his hopes drooping. She understood, 
because she understood Jesus Christ well, that there is no hope ever stirs within one 
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of us but that God hath for us the actual fulfillment of that hope. 
 

So she told him by silent ministry akin to the invisible marriage ceremony of Jesus 
Christ, that truly God would fulfill his expectations. Then aloud she said: "You will 
be successful, child." This was the "Wine" he was waiting to drink. It was the Word 
of God. "Thy words were found, and I did eat them and Thy word was unto me the 
joy and rejoicing of my heart." So he was well from that hour. 
 

This is the power of prophecy. "Prophecy is mine and sound judgment." They can tell 
of good to come who have united with the Spirit that is Divine Goodness all bounty 
without lack or failure. Whoever believes in weakness has not yet come into Cana. 
For Jesus Christ teaches that the truly joined to Spirit are filled with Omnipotence: 
"All power is given unto Me in heaven and earth." 
 

Whosoever believes in sickness is not united unto Spirit, for Jesus Christ was explicit 
and definite, "heal the sick." Do not leave people in their sickness. Do not accuse God 
of sending sickness. 
 

"As I live, saith the Lord, I know my thoughts and I think towards you thoughts of 
peace and not of evil, to bring you an expected end." 
 

The end we all expect is good unto ourselves. We deeply and profoundly love 
prosperity and peace and health. These we have a right to and nothing else. 
 

"Woman, what have I to do with thee?" 

 

"Gracious lady! Keeper of my past; now I am listening for the voice of the 
Spirit. She does not yet bid me act." 

 

So He broke away from the ways of Galilee's former hastenings, and without doing 
anything, did all things speedily. With the power of Spirit hastening through us there 
seems to the world delay, but all the world's armies of power and learning could not 
overtake our ministry if we are truly joined to God. Festina Lente. 
 

All who obey the voice of Sophia (the Spirit) heed not the ways of the guests at the 
marriage, yet they do satisfy their hearts fair hopes. Then even the great ones at the 
former marriage obeyed Him. So it is always promised to the spiritually minded that 
they shall have "Kings come bending" and all the earth shall be theirs. 
 

Notice that a woman, a "Gracious lady" recognized that He was great in Spirit. 
Cadijah recognized Mahomet. So "Woman" shall always know when the voice of the 
Spirit is speaking. And she shall tell the world what is true of Jesus Christ; also what 
is true of you and me. 
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"Six water-pots of stone." Here is our lesson for today put so plainly that he who runs 
may read. When Jesus Christ demonstrated the power of Spirit He always took the 
materials at hand such as they were; He did not take any loaves and fishes except 
such as they had on hand to look up and praise God with and feed the multitudes. 
 

He took Lazarus just as He found him. He took the "Six stone water-pots" and water 
they had at hand. Nothing else. This signifies that you are to take your rough 
circumstances, your bodily conditions, your human affairs, just as they are and 
holding them in your mind give thanks and bless the providing Jehovah that within 
them is the wine of peace and success and health. This giving thanks and praising 
God the down-bending Spirit for the wine of joy and goodness, surely contained 
within your circumstances the stone water-pots of your affairs just as they are, is the 
silent transmuting potency of Jesus the Christ. 
 

A man who takes his last copper pennies and looking up to heaven gives thanks, is 
doing that action which is the key turning into re-enforcements of Jehovah laid up for 
him from the foundation of the world. The copper pennies are all he needs to work 
with. The stone jars are your own affairs. They are just what is given you to manage 
with to show how powerful the Spirit is in dealing with you for your increasement. 
 

Archimedes said give him standing place and he would move the world. But Goethe 
was more like Jesus Christ by saying, "Make good your own standing place, and 
move the world." 
 

Jesus Christ said He would lay down His body and take it up. Moses took his own rod 
and made it a serpent; his own hand and made it leprous with a thought; his own hand 
and healed it with a thought. 
 

The queen was surprised that they had such dirty rags in a rich paper mill. But soon 
the manufacturers sent her some shining white paper made from those same rags. So 
by this lesson you may learn that you do not need one single thing to do with more 
than you already have if you know the law of praise and thanksgiving. At a faith-cure 
meeting a man kept praising God that he was so well, while a great tumor or some 
other kind of swelling was plain to be seen by his neighbors. This was his "stone 
water-pot." But he praised God publicly that he was so well for a whole fortnight. 
Long before the fortnight was up he was well, so that even his neighbors could see it 
so. 
 

Take the home as you find it, child, and turn it into a home indeed by praising God 
that there is a Spirit of Goodness working with you and through you and by you and 
for you to make all things well. 
 

Take your business as it is, child, and praise Divine Love that there is a strong, wise 
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way out of your dilemma. Take your professional hopes, your children, your work—
nothing can be more common than stone water-pots—and set them right by praising 
the Spirit. Praise is the "wine" of daily experience. The praise of Divine Love—the 
Motherhood of God is the plenteous wine of Cana of Galilee. 
 

Chicago, July 19, 1891.
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BIBLE LESSON 2 
 

JESUS CHRIST AND NICODEMUS 
 

There is always, amid the formal sectarianism of the most formal and sectarian body 
of people, one who is "A man of the Pharisees named Nicodemus." That is, by reason 
of his being called upon to teach and being in some way a leader among his 
colleagues, he has found himself unconsciously concluding that there are finer 
meanings and deeper intentions in religious precepts than he has been taught. 
 

Mind always puts out tendrils and lays hold on new meanings if it is not willfully set 
to a prejudice. The mind that makes God its theme will sooner or later meditate much 
on Jesus Christ, unless it is the mind of one determined to gratify bodily passions. 
Jesus Christ draws the mind that thinks on God as a magnet draws a steel filing. "No 
man cometh unto Me save the Father that is in Me draw him." We are drawn to those 
who have a quality akin to something within ourselves. So Nicodemus was drawn to 
Jesus. 
 

There is some great idea that your mind has been meditating upon, some principle not 
definitely understood by you, but which it is possible for you to understand perfectly. 
You ought to get acquainted with that idea. You notice, don't you, that in all the 
pauses of the business or conversations of the day the vague but great idea comes up? 
So Nicodemus had for days been looking towards the idea of the power of faith as the 
prophets of the past had demonstrated it, and as the young man traveling about the 
country was demonstrating His principles. How did it happen that Elijah raised to life 
the Zarephath child, was fed by ravens, had such prophetic powers? How did Elisha 
raise the boy to life, heal the waters, cure leprosy? Was it not by the presence and 
working of the same God that he, Nicodemus, worshiped? Why should not this God 
work miracles now as in the old days? Surely God had never departed as the health of 
His people, the strength of their life, and the answerer of their prayers, yet nothing 
was done as in days past. Why not? 
 

Maybe the young Jesus was right. He would go and see. He. had been a moralist, 
Nicodemus had, and taken pride in his morality. So he came to Jesus. High moral 
conduct, coupled with thoughts of God, is liable to strike the white heat of goodness 
as Christ quality. 
 

Jesus Christ preached His most stupendous doctrines to audiences of one and two. He 
taught over and over again not to despise the smallest circumstance or opportunity. 
"The situation that hath not its duty, its ideal, was never yet occupied by man." James 
Holmes found at Castle Bar an audience of three to hear him where he had been 
publicly announced to preach. Instead of shutting his mouth he opened it and 
preached so earnestly that one of the three, a young man, was converted, and was 
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afterwards called the "Tongue of Fire", because he was so fervent in Spirit. 
 

Jesus Christ waived the personal praise. He never received it from anybody who 
revealed His Being among them as another man with just a few points of ability, 
perhaps, above the usual Rabbi. Praise of His teachings He received. Praise principle, 
not person. Do right because it is right, and not through fear of somebody or love of 
somebody. So He drove straight to the need of Nicodemus, "Except a man be born 
again, he cannot see the Kingdom of God." "Nicodemus, except a man look into the 
Spirit only, utterly refusing to call any man of flesh, or any earthly circumstances, his 
environment as help or hindrance, he cannot set his home life, his health, his affairs, 
or his neighbor's health and affairs into harmony." 
 

How coarsely Nicodemus answered Him. The mathematician responded to the 
entranced musician concerning the marvelous music, "Yes, it is wonderful to see the 
violinist move his elbow so many times in a minute." So ''The natural man receiveth 
not the things of the Spirit, for they are foolishness unto him, and he cannot know 
them, because they are spiritually discerned." 
 

But Jesus Christ understood the law of mind. He knew how to hold the concentrated 
attention of His hearer till he should understand that ''Never the Spirit was born, the 
Spirit shall cease to be never; end and beginning are dreams." He knew that it must be 
by the recognition that all power whatsoever is of the Spirit and not of intellect or 
physical force. "Except a man be born of water and of the Spirit." The Rosetta Stone 
to all miracle-working is that lesson on the increasement of loaves and fishes. The 
Rosetta Stone to this birth of water and Spirit is the statement, "If any man will come 
after Me, let him deny himself." 
 

Now, He never taught that we should deny the good in ourselves; certainly He meant 
that we should deny the evil. He told His hearers that it was His words of which He 
was speaking and the power of His words, so we know that the baptism of water of 
which He spoke to Nicodemus was the use of the washing words of denial, whereby 
the mind that has thought things not true is cleansed of its errors, as a body is 
cleansed by water. 
 

There was certain errors or mistakes called profitless and nothingness and uselessness 
by Him, serving to hide the power of the Spirit. To deny these errors is to call them 
by name and reject them. This is the water baptism this great metaphysician meant. 
Now Naaman's seven washings in Jordan were typical of the seven denials every 
mind must make to he cleansed of error. By looking them over we know exactly what 
errors to reject and what to eschew. 
 

The first washing we do must be the rejection of the belief in another power operating 
in the universe besides omnipresent, omnipotent, omniscient Goodness. There is no 
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power of evil. This denial is the washing away of evil imaginations, so that we do not 
any more believe in the possibility of any cruelty or greed or crime coming nigh us 
forever-more. According to the law of mind action, we find that it sets the world free 
from evil also. 
 

The second washing we must do is the speaking of the positive Word of rejecting the 
belief in another substance than Spirit. If God is omnipresent Spirit, then indeed Spirit 
is the only substance present anywhere; so the rejection of the supposition of the 
reality of matter is a necessary  process. Matter has no reality, or, there is no matter. 
This Word of denial has the effect of cleansing us from as much experience of the 
hindrance or burden of matter as the law of the Word brings, spoken as an experiment 
or in faith. You certainly do find the hard tumor, the stiffened joint, or the heavy 
indebtedness grow less. This second washing is very, very efficient in making hard 
ways easy and heavy burdens light, exactly as the personified Word of truth promised 
that it should. 
 

The third washing Word (remember that Jesus Christ was always teaching words and 
thoughts and states of mind by material terms) is the denial of our false notion that 
there is any life, substance or intelligence in matter, for if there is no matter surely 
God is the only life, Spirit the only substance, Omniscience the only intelligence. 
 

An enchanting freedom comes with the third washing enjoined by Jesus Christ. The 
mind throws off the ugly nightmare of its third delusion by boldly announcing that 
there is no life, substance, or intelligence in matter. The heart rises with quickened 
hope. The friendship and beauty and goodness of living we see. The mind is clear to 
understand what is reasonable and right. Knowledge of Truth is freedom. Gautama 
Buddha and Jesus Christ both said so and proved it. 
 

Take the fourth washing Word boldly. Naaman hesitated and was petulant. We will 
press boldly forward for the mark of the high calling of Regeneration, which is the 
subject of this lesson. By this time you see that Regeneration means giving your spirit 
perfect freedom. The fourth Word of self-denial states that as matter is not a reality its 
sensations are fallacious. There are no sensations in matter. This Word will cause pain 
to falter and fail; will cause sensual appetites to fall away. We have no taste, sight, or 
hearing but for Spirit. "Taste and see that the Lord is good." "Feel after Him." 
 

The fifth washing is a severe one for some of us to take, but there is no escaping the 
metaphysical meanings of Jesus Christ. Sin, sickness, and death are delusions. This 
does not make a stealing or a slaying good, but announces that they are delusions, 
without power to hurt or hinder. The temptation to falsehood, the inclination to 
transgression, are unreal. To know this sets us free from them. Sickness and death are 
a myth. 
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Can Spirit be diseased or die? Since God is Spirit, the only Substance, the speaking of 
this washing Word of denial is the sure setting free from sin, sickness, and death. 
 

These five cleansing waters are suitable and essential for all the world. There are two 
special ones applying to each man, woman, and child, besides the five for all the 
world. You can easily find out what two you ought to make for yourself. 
 

There was once a woman who loved money so much that she saw everybody through 
her thought of money. If she looked at you she thought first of how much you were 
worth, or how much she could make out of you. You see by her looking at everybody 
and everything through money eyes, she got blind— quite blind. Money is blinding. 
If she wanted to see clearly she should deny herself of looking through money. It 
would be well for her to say much, "There is no money in Spirit." 
 

A child's toothache will depart if you say, "There is no pain in Spirit." Your burden of 
poverty will clear off if you say, "There is no poverty in Spirit." 
 

There are many who look at their acquaintances and friends and all circumstances, 
through jealous ideas of some sort. They unconsciously or consciously wonder how 
much of their own rights, or position, or possessions, the other will get away from 
them. So they have lost one or more of their faculties, for jealousy is cruel and lops 
off from us our fondest hopes. Such should deny themselves of looking and judging 
through jealousy. Let them say, "There is no jealousy in Spirit." 
 

Notice that this lesson reads that we must be cleansed by water and clothed by Spirit. 
Jesus gave the idea that we should take the house, swept and garnished, and fill it 
with good "Spirits." "Spirits" are words, as "My Words are Spirit." 
 

There are seven Words of affirmation that are the hot glory of God over and through 
all who make them. Ye came forth from God. "No man upon earth is your father." 
Thus these Words are the shining forth of your own nature with which you were 
endowed from the great Forever without beginning of years or end of days. 
 

None of the miracle-working power Nicodemus wished to be master of is ours till we 
have boldly announced the spiritual nature and office we are endowed with. 
 

This is the first affirmation of Spirit: Life, Truth, Love, is God. Then we recognize all 
Life as God and all Truth and all Love as God. We hail and welcome and praise all 
the living Beauty, all the living Strength, all the living Kindness; we recognize, 
knowing that it is God. This recognition of Good is the shining forth of our own 
Goodness. Once it was thought that we were able and capable if we recognized vanity 
or deceitfulness in a neighbor, but now we know that since vanity and deceitfulness 
are nothingness and profitless that it is a waste of time on the insubstantial. That 
which we see of Good is our own thinking or our own shining forth of our own Spirit. 
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We learned by last Sunday's lesson that everything has the potentiality of Good ready 
to increase itself by our praise and blessing. 
 

The second Word of Spirit is: "I am the idea of God, and in God I live and move and 
have my being." As God is omnipresent, we move safely and boldly on. This "Spirit" 
or Word of the I AM makes us bold and joyous. All is joyous in Spirit.  
 

The third is: "I am Spirit, I am Mind; I shed abroad Wisdom, Strength, Holiness." 
Such a fire baptism as this Word radiates or reflects from us over the world to make 
people wiser, stronger, holier where we are, is only brought to pass by this 
affirmation, or "Yea, yea," of Christ.  
 

The fourth baptism from above is our announcement that God the Spirit works 
through us to will and to do all things well. This is our Word from above, or birth 
from Spirit, that makes us efficient in healing and helping all with whom we come in 
contact. The old ways of depreciating our words and our works are done away with. 
We now rejoice in our efficiency, since we know it as God the Good doing all things. 
 

There is the fifth Word from above that secures our immunity from sin, sickness, and 
death, and that makes all the people secure when we come near them. Like the fifth 
denial the fifth affirmation takes strong rising "To do the will to prove the doctrine." 
 

I am governed by the law of God, and cannot sin, nor suffer for sin, nor fear sin, 
sickness, or death. As Spirit we cannot swerve from our orbit any more than a star in 
its course. To swerve and falter would be sin, but Spirit cannot sin for God is Spirit. 
"He'll surely guide our steps aright." There is the safe walking of all who speak these 
Words through all the thorny ways of delusion. 
 

Then the two "Other Spirits" or Words of affirmation which belong to each of you, 
you must find out for yourselves. Notice that Paul says that in his greatest weakness is 
his strength. So you can see that if you have believed yourself inefficient or ignorant 
you must let the Spirit of Truth drop down over you with the bold affirmation: "I am 
strong and efficient. I praise the Spirit that now works with me and through me and 
by me and for me to do all my work faithfully and well. I am wise with the Wisdom 
of Spirit." This is the full potency of the treatment Jesus gave Nicodemus. "Marvel 
not." Only the carnal intellect marvels, wonders, asks questions. Spirit knows. 
 

So Nicodemus rallied his faith. He had entered the presence of Jesus with hope. Hope 
is only the left hand; faith is the right hand. "Hope thou in God". Have faith in the 
Good. Your faith will show forth; your works of good faith will be good when you 
have learned how to be born of water and of Spirit according to this meaning of Jesus. 
 

July 26, 1891.
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BIBLE LESSON 3 
 

CHRIST AT SAMARIA 
 

The reason for keeping the Bible records, is because they describe the religious 
experiences of every mind under each class of circumstance recorded. Every mind has 
its religious aspiration, which is its perfume, as every flower has its perfume. 
 

Political history teaches ethics, fixing the mind on the results of injustice, justice, 
oppression, liberty, as carried on by civil authorities. 
 

Material history teaches what can be done with materiality. The silver cup lost by a 
workman in a jar of acid, precipitated by Faraday, re-made by the silversmith, 
satisfies us that we need not be utterly bereft of silver cups, though they seem utterly 
gone. The Bible records use no meaningless or unnecessary terms. 
 

Jesus Christ means Word of Truth, or Child of God. The religious aspirations of each 
mind is its Jesus Christ idea—its Word of absolute truth. The mind is a kingdom or 
realm of thoughts. The most powerful, the oldest, the noblest, is its highest Word of 
Truth, or Jesus Christ. "Come and reign over us, Ancient of Days." 
 

Thus the walk of Jesus Christ through this realm of carnal or earthly experiences is at 
each step of His going a living teaching of what to do under all the kinds of 
experiences we each have, in order to show forth Jesus Christ, or "Let the same Mind 
be in us that was in Christ Jesus." 
 

Here is the lesson of what to do when we have been trying to be good and true for a 
long period, and as nothing seems to come out of it we are tired and discouraged. 
 

We have been told positively by the spiritually-minded of every age that, 
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But though we have striven faithfully we are the most burdened and unfortunate of 
anybody we know. 
 
Jesus Christ took up all our experiences on purpose, and in the midst of every one of 
them He spoke those Words which we must speak under like circumstances. Here He 
took up the weariness and discouragement of our good motive when it sees no fruits 
in prosperity. He "sat thus on the well." 
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Do you remember the lesson He gave of what to say when you have had nothing to 
eat for a long time from any cause whatever? Do you remember what Words He told 
us to speak when physical anguish and the desertion of friends have broken our 
hearts? 
 

Well, in the same fashion He tells us what to do when exhausted, discouraged, 
disheartened with the struggle to succeed. He sat thus on the well in Samaria. Samaria 
means watch post, or posted notice. Perhaps there is nothing that will mark itself on 
your face or give your whole character away to your acquaintances like what you 
choose to do when a turning point or crisis of thinking is reached by your mind. 
 

There comes a time when the young man who has thought worldly thoughts steadily, 
suddenly carries on his face the sure sign that he is a man of the world. 
 

There comes a time when the blooming matron is called an old lady. This point just 
reached is Samaria. If the man or the woman can realize just the instant of weariness 
of the whole way of thinking and living and sit deliberately down and make the right 
resolve, a noble look will steal over the face of the young man and a new beauty will 
illumine the woman's. 
 

Once a woman caught the gleam of this rest on the wall of Samaria all in a flash and 
that which we are now carefully repeating was told to her from on high. So she sent 
out this word to all who would hear it: When you are disheartened and heartsore with 
the journey of your best efforts through this strange world, sit down and rest for the 
prayers you have prayed and the true Words you have said to be unto you a well of 
Living Water whose best draught you are about to drink, as Jesus announced the most 
refreshing doctrine He had ever put forth from the well of Samaria upon which He 
rested. When you have done the best you could, seemingly all to no purpose, put on 
your best clothes and sit down to wait for the heavenly guest who is to pass over your 
threshold that day. 
 

This is the time when you are to "Rest in the Lord and He shall bring it to pass." So a 
poor, tired, little mother with her hungry children clinging to her knees, deserted of 
her husband, friends insisting that if she had done differently things would have been 
different, while she was doing her very best, obeyed this message and rested to wait 
for the heavenly Good that must come to her that day. And the Good came. This is a 
working principle to go by. In the science of mind or metaphysics as taught by Jesus 
Christ we are taught all those Words of Truth which are Everlasting Arms 
underneath, or the well of Living Water upon which we may rely for each part of our 
journey. 
 

For instance, suppose that you have been told that God, the Divine Principle of 
Goodness, is your sure Health, and, according to the law of prayer, or affirmation of 
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Truth, you have daily and hourly spoken the words, "God is Health: no sickness or 
disease can get any hold on this Health, which is God." Yet sickness and disease do 
seem to have a hold upon your health, and you are disheartened, do not force yourself 
to speak the words then. Rest, wait. The True Health Thought is bending over you. 
Soon it will descend. This is the moment of fruition. Far in the Oriental past they 
taught that the flower of Truth blooms in the Silence after the storm and stress of 
effort. This is the time when, if you speak or work or struggle, you must start the 
work over again. 
 

An innocent man condemned to be hanged says faithfully: "I am innocent. I trust in 
my innocence to defend me. Innocence is a wall of defense. Innocence is God. You 
cannot hang me, I defy you." Yet he stands on the scaffold. There he stops for pure 
weariness the long night watches spent in this prayer of innocence. They cannot hang 
him. The words of Truth are sure. He does not look to the people to defend him. 
People always fail us. He does not look to the law books to show his cause just, for 
the law books are double-minded, but he trusts Omnipotent Principle. 
 

So if the event has hung long and heavily over your home and you have faithfully 
declared God would loose the clutch of the trouble, you must cease from prayer at 
Samaria and "Trust in the Lord, for He shall bring it to pass." The Lord is the Law of 
the Good made manifest. 
 

The fact that Jesus spoke to the woman of low origin in Samaria; the low, shows that 
the most trivial circumstance of daily transaction is to be dealt with exactly as the 
most momentous. 
 

If in making a garment, it does not come out right after your hardest efforts, rest, wait. 
Now you will do it perfectly. When looking for a situation, if you become tired or 
disheartened, rest, wait, no matter what the contingencies may be. Weary 
discouragement is the "Hail to Thee" of Samaria reached. Here is an offer better than 
you imagined. "I that speak unto thee am He." 
 

You who have been battling for your life with noble words such as the Science 
teaches concerning the impossibility of the clutch of death upon the life that is yours 
omnipotent, give up at Samaria and see how quickly the Living Water will now 
spring up within you. As Jesus Christ walked among the lowly so let this Principle 
guide you through every vicissitude, great or small. 
�
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The woman pointed to the mountain Gerizim in plain sight, where the very same 
lesson was taught by Abraham's giving up the tension as to his offering all that he had 
to the Lord, trusting utterly. 
 

All the ages have had their ministers of this Law of Life, that there is a sure Helper 
near every man, woman, and child, who will bring everything to pass for us when we 
give up the expectation of getting help from any other source. 
 

"I will lift up mine eyes unto the hills from whence cometh my help. My help cometh 
from the Lord, Which made heaven and earth." Give up the tension. The eagle ceases 
from flapping his wings, and yet on and up it soars with folded pinions, resting in the 
Law. 
 

The mountain unto which we look is the memory of the highest thought we have ever 
thought, or the highest Word that now comes into our mind. Jesus Christ said that this 
was the worship in Truth and in Spirit. 
 

Whatever is true of Spirit is true. In Spirit all is good. Thus when we speak of evil we 
are not speaking Truth, for only that which is true of Spirit is true at all. This is the 
only worship of God that is acceptable. "I am God and there is none beside." God is 
Spirit. Thou art my all. There is no higher Truth we can speak than, THOU art my all. 
 

Whoever rests securest in this statement is manifesting Jesus Christ most. To him we 
go for help as we go to a spring for water instead of going to a sand bank. 
 

The quality of your faith makes the quality of your ministry. If you believe in God as 
your support do not stop short of the highest faith of Jesus Christ, who made the fish 
precipitate the gold within his being to pay the civil tax with. Faith is he alembic 
wherein the right Word is crystallized that makes you master over every situation. 
Neither in this place nor that place, neither for one alone but for all. 
 

If you trust in the goodness of the Divine Law working for you and believe that all 
thing are made ready for you, you cannot but be a well of trust, a mountain of good 
faith to which the doubting and hungry come and dip in their cups for your ministry. 
 

Stand boldly by your faith. "I that speak unto thee am He." The-saving-from-poverty 
thought is the confidence in God as your only supply. There have been people who 
prayed till they arose from praying and found money on the table or in their purse to 
help them with. Then they were ashamed to hold on to the words of acknowledgment 
that God had indeed shown forth through them exactly as in Jesus Christ. 
 

Did He not say, "Where I Am, there ye may be also?" Why should we not be in the 
Spirit of Truth enough to believe that "All things are possible with God?" 
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How many who read that wonderful little blue magazine were ready to believe that 
the Spirit had helped those people as recorded in it? 
 

Why even those who realized the manifesting power of the Word of faith were hiding 
the copy which told of miraculous answers to prayers. 
 

If one believes in the bounty of God, keep close to him for you may dip your empty 
cup into his full waters of supply and by a metaphysical process catch the Prosperous 
Mind. If one believes in God as his unfailing Health, keep close to him for that 
metaphysical process which is like the outer air cleansing the air of a room when the 
window is opened, so may you catch Health from his Spirit of Health. 
 

Good, all Good is yours by divine right. How well your deep heart knows this. It is 
your Jesus Christ thought. Hold fast to it. "I Am He—thy Savior from poverty, 
misfortune, pain, trouble—I Am Messiah." Come boldly up to that high thought in 
your mind. Trust it. 
 

Your highest thought is that one which if it reign over you, will make you glad, 
strong, vigorous, healthy, prosperous. It is your Savior—Messiah. Not to come, but 
here already. Look for help from this Truth. 
 

August 2nd, 1891.
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BIBLE LESSON 4 
 

SELF-CONDEMNATION 
 

All is Mind and Mind's ideas. Every idea unfurls itself from your mind, as the pattern 
within a roll of cloth unrolls and exposes itself. Every thought we think first exposes 
itself in our own body, and then in our circumstances and environments. 
 

The mind is a garden-bed where the thoughts spring up. We are the husbandmen 
keeping the garden—each one our own garden. Another cannot sow a seed in our 
garden unless we please. And there is no hiding what thoughts we have chosen to 
think when the pattern of them unrolls itself and shows our body and acquaintances. 
If once we let an angry thought arise in the mind we may be sure that there will be a 
bad state of our blood, and that somebody will get very angry with us, and also that 
some angry acting circumstances will surround us. The pattern of our thought which 
we let spring up within us does not show forth, sometimes, for months or even years. 
 

You see the first statement of this lesson is, "My Father worketh hitherto, and I 
work." This is the Law of mind, to think and show forth. So we think and show forth 
our thoughts as our Origin, Mind, does. If we once thought an unjust thought we must 
not he surprised if the physical affliction we suffer seems very unjust when we have 
tried to be so good. Then there is the man or the woman who uses us so unjustly. 
Then the circumstances and environments. 
 

This lesson for today takes up our thought of self-condemnation which we once 
indulged in, and shows us how to speak words and think thoughts which will utterly 
undo the results of our self-condemnation. Jesus Christ voluntarily took upon Himself 
all our experiences after they have fruited in the worst possible consequences, and 
made it very plain for us to know exactly what to do. 
 

Sometimes we condemn ourselves for having done exactly what we ought to have 
done, as if, for instance, it were against the rules of the house where we were stopping 
to feed beggars, but we had not only fed one, but taken her in and washed and dressed 
her because we saw that she was a good, worthy woman. There in Jerusalem it was 
against the law of the city to heal a man in public on the Sabbath as Jesus had healed 
the paralytic man at the pool of Bethesda. 
 

If you will read this (John 5. 17:20) you will find out what to do and say when your 
motive was all right, but things have all turned out wrong because you condemned 
yourself, and now people are blaming you terribly. You are to let the motive be its 
own justification. A good motive is the power of God working in you to will and to 
do of its own good pleasure. Just lean hard on the motive itself and declare as Jesus 
Christ did, "God moveth and I must act." 
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The Bethesda lesson which introduces this, is quite important. A man had been 
paralyzed in body thirty-eight years to show that once he thought a wrong thought. 
Bethesda means Healing Mercy. Nobody ever had even a whole garden bed of 
sickening thoughts but what he vaguely or definitely thought of mercy at the same 
time. 
 

Many people have put their thoughts of healing mercy together and caused an angel 
(which means pure thought, manifest or unmanifest) to come and stir their conscious 
minds to a quickening faith in actual healing. They saw their thought manifest as a 
lovely being stirring the pool, and into this they dipped their sick. But this man had 
thought a thought which had now externalized in even his environments being 
paralyzed. Do you see by this how it is that so many people are not cured of their 
diseases even by the combined healing thoughts of their acquaintances? Do you not 
see that it takes the presence of Jesus Christ face to face with all the power of the 
Jesus Christ word to heal certain kinds of troubles? 
 

Now, no matter what the garden of your mind, where the thoughts spring up, may be 
full of, just know this, that you are given power to pull up and burn whatever thoughts 
you have thought, and if you will close the soil of your mind tightly around one word, 
not allowing another single word to grow up there till the full ministry of this new 
word is accomplished, you will find that everything in your experience will be 
different. 
 

According to this lesson the word we must speak is Jesus Christ. Every word carries 
its own quality of power with us and through us and by us and for us when we speak 
it. Notice that no other word of Healing Mercy availed this man at the pool except 
Jesus Christ. "In Him is all the fullness of the Godhead bodily." The Egyptians, 
Persians, Greeks and Romans all used to heal by names. They wrought many miracles 
by giving all their mind to the holding of one name to the exclusion of every other 
name. But there was always a point where their names stopped its potency. The name 
always carried the idea of its ministry or the ministry of the man who bore it. As his 
ministry was limited and imperfect his name suggested limitation. Once, "In the 
beginning the Word was God," but by thinking of God as a Being sending pain and 
trouble a veil has come over the name to us, and since the unlimited perfect ministry 
of Jesus Christ we have to speak that name with our whole heart till all the perfect 
work which His name conveys is manifested in us. "There is none other name given 
under heaven whereby we can be saved." So there are certain ones among you who 
will never be healed, never helped out of your troubles, till you have spoken the 
name, Jesus Christ, with your whole mind as intent upon it as it is possible for it to be. 
The names David, John, Moses, anybody else but Jesus, carries a panorama of 
limitation, failure, sin. 
 

The faith-cure people have wrought many miracles in the name of Jesus, but it is 
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noticeable how afraid they are of draughts, night airs, accidents, other religious 
beliefs, etc. So there is not perfect ministry by them. The Christian scientists have 
wrought many miracles by the name of Christ, carefully explained as Truth, but there 
have been divisions, strifes, intolerance among them and thus there has been 
something lacking. So now this lesson explains, that is the verses before the 
seventeenth do, that it must be by the whole name that we are to be wholly saved. 
 

When the officers asked of Peter and John in whose name they healed the man born 
lame, they answered: "In the name of Jesus Christ." Do not stop to explain the word. 
Make haste to clear your mind of its old errors, exactly as the lesson of July twenty-
sixth* declares, and proceed to hold the full word Jesus Christ till the full ministry is 
done in you and you have clear access to the Father. This makes you equal with Jesus 
Christ in the power of the Spirit, as He promised: "Where I Am there ye may be also." 
"Ask in my name." 
 
*Bible lesson No. 2.—Jesus Christ and Nicodemus. 
 

Jesus Christ on this occasion, while showing us what to do when we seem to have 
broken some man-made law, taught us that as He troubled the old Jewish Sabbath 
right near the place where the angel troubled the waters, so we may put all actions 
prompted by high motives onto the responsibility of The Father or The Spirit which is 
the good motive itself and need not explain ourselves. 
 

Only "What He seeth the Father do." The Father is Love. Only what Love bids us do 
can we do if we have a good motive. Good Motive is God. God is Love. "Sheweth 
Him all things." We are shown exactly what to do under all circumstances and in all 
places. The son of God is the perfect motive to do good." The Son quickeneth whom 
He will." The perfect word in the mind will quicken those who seem dead. We shall 
see the whole name Jesus Christ quicken the dullest and stupidest people to thinking 
so harmoniously that the red blood will flow swiftly, the hard joints will limber, and 
the eyes will flash with light. This name spoken will teach us to raise the quickening 
life and beauty of our friends into plain sight. 
 

"He that believeth shall not come into condemnation." This text is the main point for 
self-treatment when all things point to our having made some seemingly very false 
moves which nobody approves. We must deny self-condemnation and the 
condemnation of others. "There is no condemnation." Do not forget to say, "I am not 
under self-condemnation. I am not under the law of condemnation." Your mind will 
clear itself, and you can speak the word "Jesus Christ" unto swift power. 
 

"The resurrection of life and the resurrection of damnation," said Jesus. He meant that 
you would see the life, of the True Word demonstrated and the death or disappearance 
of the false word. The idea of condemnation of good motives for any actions, the idea 
of persecution for the Jesus Christ healing, will be demonstrated as pure nothingness. 
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"My judgment is just." Why is the Jesus Christ judgment just? Because no earthly 
ambition is consulted. The Jesus Christ word makes you no time-server. You are on 
the side of Omnipotence when you are in the right. Lean hard on the right and say, as 
Jesus did: "All power is given unto Me because My judgment is just." When 
Abraham Lincoln was asked if he was sure God was on his side, he answered: "I am 
not so much concerned to know whether God is on my side as whether I am on God's 
side." 
 

"Be strong, and of a good courage; fear not nor be afraid of them; for the Lord thy 
God, He it is that doth go with thee; He will not fail thee, nor forsake thee." 
 

August 9th, 1891.
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BIBLE LESSON 5 
 

FEEDING THE STARVING 
 

This lesson is about Jesus Christ's going across the Sea of Galilee, up into a mountain 
and sitting down to the working out of a problem of human life. 
 

The going across the sea, instead of around it is a hint of the metaphysical Law of 
taking the straight line as the shortest distance between two points. 
 

By this lesson I know that there is no need of waiting for summer and winter, seed 
time and harvest to feed people. Also, Jesus Christ settled the question for all time as 
to the duty of the spiritual or Christian teacher in the matter of feeding the multitudes 
as well as healing and comforting them. 
 

You may be sure that there is a short cut or direct route to all accomplishments. 
French and music should be learned at once without long years of drill. Success is 
your immediate right without years of painstaking effort. Are you not one with the 
Origin of all power and all knowledge? Does that substance or divine region of you 
have to learn anything? No. Let the Divine of you reign and like Jesus Christ you 
enter at once upon your inheritance. 
 

Simply because you have heretofore gone around and not across the sea of your life, 
need not count against your acceptance of the divine guidance now with you and for 
you and in you. Jesus of Nazareth settled the question once what to do when falsely 
condemned; of what to do when deserted by your friends and in humiliation; of what 
to do when there is a death in your family, of what to do with sickness, of what to do 
when you yourself are buried in a tomb past all hope. Today He settles the question of 
feeding starving, people. 
 

This vital spark of divinity you now represent might be fanned by you into a living, 
quickening fire of bright genius if you would let it have its way. Genius always does 
things in a new, unexpected way. Napoleon conquered armies, not by the usual arts of 
war or military tactics, but in his own way. Abe Lincoln won victories and ran the 
government to a new tune. Jesus Christ took this time to set aside the circuit of 
summer and winter and seed time and harvest and make bread at once. He explained 
the modus operandi of quick accomplishments.  
 

Elijah once kept a widow's cruse full at Zarephath. Elisha replenished one at Gilgal 
and fed one hundred men with twenty loaves of bread, but neither of them explained 
the process. Jesus here explains it. 
 

First, "He went up into a mountain and sat down." This means that He went into an 
exalted state of mind. There is no power of healing in a depressed state of mind. 
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There is no quickening of the exhausted by a sorrowful or anxious state of mind. In 
order to work your best, metaphysically, you must be in an exalted state of mind. 
Now, there are two ways of getting into an exalted state of mind. There is the short 
and direct way of Jesus, and there is the longer but just as sure way of Job. 
 

The short, direct way of Jesus Christ is the one now used by the Christian scientists. It 
is by denial and affirmation, as explained three or four weeks ago. You remember that 
He denied the reality of material things by saying, "The flesh profiteth nothing." He 
denied the power of evil by saying, "It is a lie from the beginning." He affirmed "All 
power is given unto Me," and "I and the Father are one." His manner of speaking has 
a very exalting effect upon the mind, and to rest in that state of exaltation is the sure 
healing of your sick mother and the sure bringing to pass of success. Exaltation is a 
magnet for all good things of the universe to hasten to you. Depression and anxiety 
are a magnet for trouble to fly to you. 
 

But you are saying, "How can I be other than depressed and anxious when my father 
has failed in business, my brother is a drunkard, and my mother is paralyzed?" Then 
you must take Job's way of getting into an exalted state of mind. Job reasoned with 
the Almighty. He told the Almighty face to face that His own hands having fashioned 
him he could not be wicked and that he would maintain his righteous cause before 
Him. 
 

This reasoning out your own case with that divine Presence that folds you so close is 
a mighty help to your state of mind, and never was known to fail anybody. The 
poorest and most unhappy can plead their cause with this Presence. An old colored 
woman reasoned her's out this way, "Dear Lord Jesus, if I was you, so great and 
powerful and happy, I'd help you ef you'se a pore ole cull'd mammy and had lost yore 
nice little picaninny, as 1 have. Sho' you can't be not so good as me ef I was you, dear 
Lord Jesus." And the Lord Jesus took hold of the old mammy's hand and led her 
through the bogs and the morasses and the forests and the white men to her picaninny. 
 

The great account made of "sparrows" fills our hearts with gladness. A man who had 
to feed the soldiers in a camp, was ordered to give them half slices at a time when 
they had been extra worked and were extra hungry. He reasoned with the divine 
Goodness as a man talketh with his brother, that according to the righteous law of 
supply and demand these men should have double rations instead of half ones. Then 
he ordered his under officer to double the thickness of the slices, and before he got 
through distributing the first lot a wagon load of provisions drove into camp. 
 

Be sure to be very definite in stating your case. Do not let your emotion consume 
your words. Be on hand to mumble out something besides intense emotion of grief, or 
anger, or fear. The "Word" is very essential. "Without the Word was nothing made." 
"If a man eat of the Word I give him, though he were dead, yet shall he live again." 
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Then when your mind gets into an exalted state, trust God. "Whom have I in heaven 
but Thee, and there is none upon earth that I desire beside Thee." This is the 
confidence of mind which Jesus emphasized by sitting down in the mountain. Now, in 
this calm state of confidence you may take deliberate account of your assets and 
liabilities. 
 

The same is true in cases of illness and domestic sorrow, as in this case of penury or 
seeming failure of supplies in running your home or affairs of any kind. So if we 
understand this case, we understand all cases. You take account of liabilities and 
necessities. That is your Philip thought. Notice how Philip said that there were five 
thousand people and it would take thirty-four dollars worth of bread to feed them. 
Andrew told the assets, "Five barley loaves and two fishes." Without noticing the 
hopeless calculations of Philip or the tiny comfort of Andrew, Jesus Christ bade the 
five thousand to "sit down on the grass" just exactly as if there were plenty on hand. 
 

So you, when your faith hath come into its word, "All my trust on Thee is staid; all 
my health from Thee I bring," do you go right on with your affairs and works just 
exactly as if your bounty was visible. This is not the time to economize and withhold. 
This is the time to use right up to the last of the assets, right on to the heels of the last 
penny, as the two widows poured freely forth what seemed the last of the meal and 
the oil. 
 

Every stroke you make towards penuriousness  and  retrenchment  of  fair  expenses 
will cost you double. This is the time when you look up and give thanks for your 
assets, give loving thanks for five loaves and two fishes to do a five-thousand dollar 
business with. 
 

Jesus Christ did not roam around despising the meeting of people on their own 
ground of wants, but He found out their wants and wills and met them there. Who 
cares about flying round a throne on wings with our children and mothers after death, 
when a good home and ability to make it happy here is what the heart craves? Jesus 
Christ helped people here to see that there is in themselves all power to get out of 
every condition undesirable, and beyond that the ability to do great works in proof of 
Sonship and Oneness with the One who created them. Nothing is too small or too 
simple to reason with Jesus Christ about. Jesus Christ is God manifest. To reason with 
Him is to become more and more merged in Him. 
 

By this time you have caught the secret of reasoning with Jesus Christ, or the 
Almighty. You cannot help seeing that if we become like those we converse with we 
should soon become so lost in the knowledge of the Character of Jesus Christ that His 
very miracle-working power would be ours. You have now caught the Principle, have 
you not, that if you describe God you become exactly as great as you describe God to 
be, as fast as you realize what you are talking? A man once had a habit of lying with 
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his face down praising God for knowing him altogether. After a time he got so wise 
that he could tell all the past and present and future of all the people he met. 
 

So if you praise God as Supreme giving—Supreme bounty, you may hand out and 
hand out and hand out, for back of you is infinite supply. "There is that scattereth and 
yet increaseth, and there is that withholdeth more that is meet and tendeth to poverty." 
 

This teaches that God is unto us according to our faith; therefore dreadfully 
economical people do not have much faith if they carry their careful saving unto 
hoarding up lest they come to want. If they hoard for giving farther after all the 
present bounty has filled their neighbors they will increase it and increase it till they 
have to call to the streets of foreign cities to get people enough to partake of their 
bountiful stores. 
 

Wonderful words are those with which you describe the Almighty. They react on you 
so wonderfully. They are alive. There is no wonder that so many people have said, 
"There is no God only the one you imagine, because you get exactly what you 
imagine God to be giving." 
 

Then again, it was a very good expression of one man to say, "An honest God is the 
noblest work of man," because if you describe God as revengeful you soon get 
revengeful; if you describe God as love and justice you soon become just and loving. 
If you describe God as niggardly and apt to send afflictions you soon get stingy and 
full of sorrows. 
 

This lesson enjoins strict reasoning, strict truth—right description of God. 
 

August 16, 1891.
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BIBLE LESSON 6 
 

THE BREAD OF LIFE 
 

It is one of the first teachings of metaphysics that all environments, circumstances, 
conditions, all the people who come near us, and everything else, existed first as ideas 
in our own mind and now appear in plain sight to be known and read plainly. 
 

The science of metaphysics which Jesus Christ taught deals with the meta, beyond, 
and physics, that is beyond, out of the range of, the physical. The mental is the 
metaphysical. 
 

This being true, he is our greatest teacher who can tell us how to think such thoughts 
as shall keep us from making failures, sorrow's, blind people, deaf people inferior 
people, hard circumstances to surround us. He is our greatest teacher who can tell us 
how to make harmonious circumstances, success in our undertakings, perfect people 
to surround us. He is our greatest teacher who can tell us how to redeem our life from 
those failures, hardships, poor people our former thoughts have fruited into.  
 

He will be our divinely good friend who shall teach us to think such thoughts as shall 
cause us to sit down in due season under the vine and fig tree of our exactly right 
ideas. 
 

Jesus Christ is this teacher and this friend. There was no circumstance and no 
condition which we have walled ourselves into that He did not take upon Himself and 
teach us how to redeem ourselves from   the consequences of our erring thoughts. 
Redemption was the story Jesus Christ taught. And redemption is the theme of all 
these lessons, where He is making an object lesson of Himself for our benefit.  
 

He taught us to say, "How I am glorified," when physical anguish and desertion of 
friends come upon us for believing in the power of evil and the reality of matter. 
 

Have you learned the lesson so well that you also have redeemed yourself from 
physical anguish and have chosen unto yourself many loving friends when you seem 
to have none? No? Then you need not be surprised if anguish still gets a hold on you 
and you still feel lonely. Words are ideas. True words are alive and good. 
 

So if you are in the deeps of sorrow you speak living words that can bear your mind 
out on their wings into a paradise of peace. True words are angels. 
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Once a woman believed that Jesus Christ meant it as a signal to her of what to say for 
her feet, which had a habit of paining excruciatingly. So she said: "Father, how Thou 
hast glorified me." And she felt as if she were actually being borne upon wings of 
delight, so free and at peace her feet hastened to be. 
 

He taught us what to say when we have come to our last dollar and have no visible 
means of support. He taught us what to say when we are condemned by our family 
and neighbors for having acted according to our highest light. He here condescends to 
our low estate where we have brought around us a tribe of sycophants, or people who 
think of us as simply a provider, and feeder and caretaker for them. 
 

He here shows us what state of mind we must have been in to have caused such a 
state of affairs. He shows that it has been because of our mixed beliefs, as first we 
have believed in the necessity for hard work to accomplish that which we wished to 
accomplish; and secondly, we have been ambitious for fame of some kind, some 
earthly honor or emolument; thirdly, we have believed that we ought to carry out our 
own will at whatever cost somewhere or sometime along our journey over this planet. 
 

The people who followed Jesus this time went for the food, not for His doctrine at all. 
He takes us at the point where we realize that people want to use us, not to honor us 
by being near us. You have all had this experience more or less, and it always stands 
for the coming to outward expression of your self-will, ambition, and belief in the 
great results of hard work. 
 

The Christian scientist often has this state of affairs, and is grieved by it. He or she 
has the definite instruction of what to do with the thoughts to be "raised up" at the last 
extremity of such a situation. Perhaps it might all be summed up in that general 
statement of Truth which the scientist makes when learning the lessons of mental 
responsibility. "There is no life, substance, or intelligence in matter;" but this 
direction is much more explicit than that, and tells you to deny that there is any 
necessity in your lot for hard labor, deny that you ever hoped great things from 
earthly honors, and deny emphatically that you were ever self-willed. 
 
 

When the Christian scientist suddenly discovers that her patient is not her friend and 
does not believe in the science, though he has said he was and did, but was only 
making believe in order to get his arms cured, failing which for a time he repudiates 
the whole doctrine and his obligations of every kind to her, she is grieved and 
astonished, often discouraged. 
 

Now nobody has any more religion than just as much as he can command in time of 
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trial. This religion of Jesus teaches you exactly what to do and say to redeem yourself 
from grief, disappointment, failure. Also that if you deal exactly right with your own 
mind, the people around you will spring right up into right conditions. Even the 
patient who shows that he or she just looked upon you as a useful penwiper or door-
mat for them and so were not promptly cured, he will be cured if you understand this 
lesson. Jesus Christ did not despise healing the people, feeding them, furnishing 
money or anything else for them. He did not look down upon any humble ministry, 
but He knew that to look at money for its own sake, or food for its own sake, or 
healing for its own sake, is a belief in the value of earthly things which must be 
denied. There must be no belief in the necessity for hard labor in anybody's lot. Rest 
remaineth for the people of God as to manual labor for meat, bread, house, health. 
 

The seeking of God first through faithfully speaking right words will bring anybody 
into such spiritual power that "all these things are added" without effort. Ambition to 
merit reward by works is discountenanced by Jesus Christ. Nobody is saved by 
works. Salvation by works was the early teaching of Christian science as set forth by 
William S. Adams fifty years ago in his book on Christian science. John Knox was 
told that his good works would save him. He fought all night against the belief that 
they would. He came into the understanding that faith in Jesus Christ, or believing the 
Word of Christ, which is Truth, was salvation. 
 

Here Jesus Christ urges every man, woman, and child to believe in the heart what is 
true, and this believing, or right faith, will feed, clothe, support them. This one must 
do by words that are right, very vigorously uttered, when he has been brought up to 
believe that his bread and butter for himself and family are dependent upon his hard 
efforts. It is a bad idea to get its hold in any mind. Ben Franklin had that belief so 
hard that he ran it into a saving up and hoarding state of mind that nearly warped the 
happiness out of the lot of nearly all the farmers' children of New England. 
 

It is a very unspiritual idea, and must be boldly handled, torn up by the roots, out of 
mind. 
 

Say positively: "I do not believe in hard work as necessary for myself or anybody else 
to live comfortably in God's universe." This saving by works will make a man or 
woman who has struggled hard, feel that he or she has earned some rights to extra 
blessings in heaven. It will cause a certain class of mind to think that outward actions 
will satisfy all the demands of God on the soul, as Admiral Nelson, who broke his 
wife's heart, but did so much service to his country, felt sure he had earned the right to 
an extra good place in heaven. 
 

The Lord looketh on the heart! Nothing is worth working for except a right state of 
mind. All the greatest, good men and women the world has ever known have found 
out a great principle of life in the knowledge that we are not walking over this planet 
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for the purpose of making for ourselves a great name, gathering to ourselves riches, 
honors, friends, but to do the will of God in that estate whereunto we are called. 
 

The preacher must come to where he knows it is not to convert men to Christ, not to 
make the world better, not to be great in the cause of God, but to do the will of God, 
willingly. The will of God often pushes the great man or the great woman into the 
quick fruits of his mistaken thoughts, so that he is in mean and small circumstances, 
out of which he must extricate himself by speaking the same simple truths the wash-
woman and hod-carrier must speak. He will find himself in great extremities, or "at 
the last day," as Jesus here in this lesson expresses it. But if he do the will of God, or 
meekly speak the right words he will be "raised up." 
 

The righteous man often has a belief in hard labor, is ambitious to be great, is self-
willed, so he has great things depending upon his efforts, has people depending upon 
him who ought to be doing for themselves, and is harassed by the failures of his plans 
or their delay in coming out right till he is brought to great extremities. He must take 
the denial of Jesus, "I came not to do mine own will. I do not care for earthly honors. 
I am no time server." 
 

Then when he has said in all sincerity, "I am doing the will of God," this denial and 
affirmation will cause his plans to be "raised up." They will be wonderfully 
successful. He himself will be honored. He will be "raised up" in joy and delight. 
Notice that the "raised up" is, first, for the works or plans, and second, for the man. 
All things were taught by this man of God, Jesus Christ. He is our highest idea of man 
as a Son of God. If you understand Him, you will be redeemed from evil and will 
redeem your world from evil. 
 

August 23, 1891.
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BIBLE LESSON 7 
 

THE CHIEF THOUGHT 
 

"When Christ Cometh." These people were expecting a Messiah or Christ. That which 
they were expecting as a body of people, each one of us is always expecting. 
 

Look carefully into your own mind, examine your kingdom of thoughts, and you will 
see that there is always a region of you which is intensely looking for deliverance 
from your environments. This is your Jewry. Now your Christ or deliverer is standing 
right in yourself, telling you the exact way out this minute. 
 

Job said: "Is not my help in me?" Within me is one thought, that if I heed it will lift 
me out of every situation and circumstance which the Roman yoke on the Jews 
typified, So with you. What is true of you is true of every sentient thing. Now the 
Christ thought in you;. which will save you, you do not let have its way with you. 
Why don't you? Each mind is a kingdom of thoughts. We have all power over the 
kingdom of our own thoughts. We may let a Pharisaic thought or a chief priest 
thought shut off the beautiful one within us which always says "I Am thy Savior." 
 

Hush all your realm of thoughts for a moment and let that one which says "I am 
Christ" speak. You can. actually work miracles if you let that thought have full sway 
over your other thoughts. These lessons of Jesus Christ among the Jews and Gentiles 
represent your Jesus Christ thought within yourself. Each thought says "I am" You let 
that one have reign over you which you please. "I am envy," says one thought; "I am 
bigotry," says another; "I am success," says another; "I am your Savior from all evil," 
says the greatest One within your realm. 
 

This greatest thought is your oldest thought. It was with you in the beginning, is with 
you now, and ever shall be with you, world without end. It is the "Ancient of Days." 
"Come and reign over us, Ancient of Days." 
 

Notice this, if you please, that your pious thought, representing the traditions of the 
past as to the severity of God, is quick to take and bind your Jesus Christ thought, 
Your Pharisaic thought, representing your past teachings as to your inferiority before 
God, always chokes down the generous, Sabbath-breaking Christ thought. 
 

Now Jesus Christ, or the power of Truth, is in you all. This power of Truth you 
cannot kill, but you may hide it if you please for a while. "Yet a little while am I with 
you," it says just as quickly as your piety and bigotry are roused. For the power of 
God is never manifested where pious bigotry is allowed rule. 
 

When this knowledge of the ways of thoughts in the mind became known to some 
very brave thinkers they voluntarily let all their thoughts keep perfect silence while 
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the Jesus Christ thought spoke in them, saying: "I Am the Messiah. I Am Jesus 
Christ." They all reported wonderful experiences. It seemed to them as if their whole 
being was God being. There was nothing but God "above them all and through them 
all and in them all." Jesus Christ is God. This is not person, but Principle. Jesus Christ 
is the voice, the power of God. These people all became strong through and through. 
They became well and sound through and through. Their judgment became strong and 
healthy. They are sure that if you will not let your old prejudices blind you, but will 
let your highest thought have freedom, you will rise like a bird out of the snare of the 
fowler, free in God. 
 

Listen to that highest idea within your realm of ideas. Here is its message: "If any 
man thirst, let him come unto Me, and drink." You know you are thirsty for 
something. If your friends love you, you still are thirsty. If you have money you still 
are thirsty. If you have fame you still are thirsty. If you are learned in books you still 
are thirsty. You will always be thirsty for something till you let your highest idea 
reign over you. 
 

It says: "I am your lover, your friend, your counselor, your satisfaction." There is no 
other way of receiving Jesus Christ except this one. It is the principle that is never 
absent from the mind of any man or woman or child. No matter what you have done 
or thought, if you will let your thoughts all hold still for this one to rise in its majesty, 
you are good and great and wise and healthy that moment. The satisfaction of living 
is yours when forth from you flows the living water of your highest idea only. This is 
not the doctrine of salvation by works. It is not the doctrine of salvation by faith in 
anybody or anything. 
 

It is salvation by the "let there be" of Moses and Jesus of Nazareth. It was by keeping 
silent for God to be the whole of Him that Jesus was enabled to say so boldly, "I and 
the Father are one. He that hath seen Me hath seen the Father." Spinoza was so lost in 
finding the power of God over and through and in him so wonderfully, that he was 
called the God-intoxicated man. 
 

Many people have been afraid to let their Jesus Christ thought be their only thought. 
It seemed suddenly to them as if they themselves were all Jesus Christ, all God, 
nothing else of them. Why they could possibly be afraid to have their mind occupied 
by one perfect idea is a mystery. To hold back from speaking this idea in the mind, or 
rather letting the idea speak itself, is to put off the power of the Holy Ghost 
(according to this lesson.) 
 

The Holy Ghost is the quickening power of God. The Holy Ghost has not come while 
you are sick, while you are poor, while you are lame, while you are unhappy. And 
you cannot have the Holy Ghost till you have been silent enough for the Jesus Christ 
idea that is within your realm of ideas to speak its words within you very definitely. 

36



Do not be afraid of being Jesus Christ. Do not be afraid of any experience that comes 
with letting this wonderful idea speak within you. Do not let your thoughts rise up 
with all kinds of babblings like they did in the Nazareth Man's time. They said: "Shall 
Christ come out of Galilee?" 
 

You may comfort yourself by knowing that the high doctrine of "Let these be" says: 
"Let the same mind be in you that was in Christ Jesus our Lord." Your mind is not too 
low a place for your best thoughts to reign over your poor ones in. The poor ones are 
completely redeemed when they lie still as death for that ever-present one to say: "I 
Am thy Messiah. I Am thy Savior, thy Friend, thy Counselor, thy mighty Judgment, 
thy Power and Majesty forever." 
 

Here the Jews refused the Messiah because they feared that Galilee was not good 
enough for Him to come out of. You are exactly that when you think you are not good 
enough to have a thought anywhere within you which is the Savior, the Righteous. 
 

Some men have not let this thought in their mind be Jesus Christ because that word 
seemed to them to be a man with a religious system to urge and not a principle, so 
they have let this supreme thought within them say: "I am God, and I reign over thee." 
Now, in the beginning that was indeed the Word, but by accusing God of so many 
dealings He could not possibly be guilty of, we have all drawn a veil over our faces, 
and the Deep crying unto Deep within us saying, "I am God," does not bring the 
power of God so quickly as by letting the idea Jesus Christ be spoken till the veil is 
rent. At the same time there is no difference in the meaning of the words. The 
principle idea within your mind is the God idea. You are expected to work miracles. 
Every one of you who takes this mode of dealing with the mind will find yourselves 
converted to uprightness, rejoiced with new powers, filled with health. There is 
nothing out of the power of one who lets all his mind rest for one thought only to 
speak. You have the power to call back those who are called dead. You have the 
power to turn copper into gold. There are strange powers lying dormant, as it were, 
within you, which, keeping all your thoughts still for one thought to rise in its glory, 
would quicken. This is the "mystery of Godliness." It is spoken of as the Lion of 
David, because only victorious people are supposed to have the powers of God with 
them. But everybody is a victory over the world by this process. There is nothing to 
do, nothing to believe, only "Let be what is; let speak what is true." 
 

Of course you have heard that Truth is Omnipotence. I assure you that it is. Let speak 
within you that secret, silent word, while all your other thoughts lie low. "Behold, I 
have put My Name upon thee." Even while you thirst for the child to be well, the 
home to be harmonious, the environments not to cramp you so, behold in your midst, 
that is in your realm of thoughts, stands the Christ. 
 

So now you see how the Kingdom of Heaven is within you. Many people are letting 
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this thought in the midst of them speak till there is great meekness and lowliness of 
heart where before was pride and arrogance. They do not care for name and fame and 
rule where before they were ambitious. For you know that Jesus Christ is not 
ambitious. Your highest thought is meek and lowly of heart. 
 

Let the night watches find you still while your highest "I am" speaks. All that you 
dream of as desirable is in that redeeming word. So many people catching this 
knowledge of the metaphysical instructions given by Jesus Christ for our example are 
the hastening on of that time of which the prophet spoke, "Many saviors shall come 
up from Jerusalem." Jerusalem means peace. So from the peace of letting thoughts He 
still for the Christ one to say, "I Am thy Redeemer," saviors are springing up all over 
the earth. "They shall all be taught of God" is the prophecy. This God-thought that 
waits within you, being led to say, "I am" will teach you all things and remind you of 
that country from whence you came forth and unto which you return. 
 

You have a wonderful kingdom of thoughts. Which one reigns now? 
 

August 30, 1891.
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BIBLE LESSON 8 
 

CONTINUE THE WORK 
 

"If ye continue in My Word," said Jesus Christ, "then are ye my disciples." This 
discourse of Jesus before the Jews in the court of the Temple at Jerusalem, is all about 
the Power of the Word. 
 

If anyone is unaware of the potency of the idea he is holding in mind to strike out 
over his daily affairs and into his bodily conditions then he is not yet acquainted with 
Christian doctrine. 
 

Take the idea that you are at this moment holding. What is it? The strongest idea one 
set of people hold is that if something does not turn up within a certain time only a 
miracle can save them from something or other that is threatening. This is an idea that 
makes the atmosphere strained and attenuated and gives the children nervous cramps, 
and the rest of the family neuralgia. 
 

Take that idea and change it into this one: "I have a right to the best, and I will trust to 
my rights to bring me out right." 
 

As your child has a right to your love and to your protection, and trusts his right, so 
have you a right to protection in this universe into which you are born. 
 

Trust bravely. Trust like a child and a potentate. Socrates said that a state of grief or 
anxiety would attract sickness, waste of property, and death. Grief is a word held in 
the mind. A word is an idea. 
 

"For the lightest word thou shalt give account." The words of Jesus Christ, He 
promised, would lead into comfort, joy, peace, power. Alike attracts like. You hold a 
strong, loving thought on purpose; hold it tenaciously; directly, strong loving 
successes will crown your efforts. This is metaphysics. This is a psychologic study 
left out in the school books, but is, indeed, the metaphysics of Jesus Christ. 
 

Here He shows what will be the effect of speaking His words, which are all true. Ye 
shall be free. "The Truth shall make you free." 
 

The Truth He told is so stupendous that many a noble preacher has refused to speak it. 
Take this word He told you to speak, for instance, "I and the Father are one." People 
think mostly that He meant only Jesus of Nazareth was one with God. Not at all. He 
meant that you and I are one with the Father. "Where I Am there ye may be also." 
 

You are looking for freedom of some sort. The fact that you are searching for 
freedom is evidence that you do not know Truth. "The Truth makes free," remember. 
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The Russian peasant cowered and shrank like a frightened spaniel while he believed 
that the shadows in the field were filled with vampires, but when he knew that there 
was no such thing as a vampire in the shadow he stood up and walked free. The Truth 
made him free. When you know that a draught of air has no neuralgia or rheumatism 
in it for you, you will not shrink and cower like a spaniel when a damp draught strikes 
you. "The truth shall make you free." 
 

"But," you say, "the damp draught does give me neuralgia." No. That idea of yours 
about the failure of your business, or the injustice of your neighbor, or the envious 
thought against another, brought the neuralgia. "Oh," but you say, "my little innocent 
child has the neuralgia from damp air." No, it has not; it was your idea that folded it 
around like a magnet to draw trouble unto its little self. "Envy is the rottenness of the 
bones," says the Scripture. 
 

To believe in the claims of weather, inheritance, climate, etc., is to be in bondage. 
There is a way of getting free from the effects of false words in good science. You 
take each word as it comes into your mind and mix it and mold it and rectify it by 
right words till you would never know it to be the word you set out with. 
 

Each word of Truth is a setting-free principle. The Scriptures are true. See how senile 
decrepitude is getting the bondage over your eyesight. Do you know that instead of 
losing your sight as the years go on you ought to increase in sight? Can you imagine 
what idea made you put on glasses? It was something along the line of your human 
experience which you said about the "Lord having dealt very bitterly by you," or 
making your lot hard, or your burden heavy. 
 

This compels you to take up that thought which, though it lies unconscious in your 
realm is there just the same, and needs rectifying. Say to the old past, bitter cry, I see 
that God is good to me, God is good to me." Mold and mold that old-time word till it 
rises within you a joyous certainty that God is indeed good to you. Then your 
eyesight will return to you. 
 

Suppose that your hearing is feeble. That shows that you have had many gods or 
idols. Some things have been very, very dear to you, or very, very powerful over you. 
"Hear, O Israel, the Lord our God is One." Take your dearest treasure or your greatest 
fear and say, "There is only One God—One." Soon your hearing will be restored. In 
this lesson Jesus Christ speaks of continuing in His Word. His Word. By this He 
intimates what deaf and blind often do, begin good words and drop speaking them 
soon. "Repetition is the mother of wisdom." If you keep speaking the right word, 
which is the word that fits your particular case, you will get great light on the 
principle involved by the word. This is explained by the speed with which a child 
understands the principle of the multiplication table, if he speaks it much. 
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There are reasons why sight and hearing must be mentioned in this connection, it 
seems; notice how He speaks of what He sees with His father and what they see and 
do with their father. Sight and hearing are entirely dependent upon our own ideas of 
God. Wrong ideas of God are now causing the whole human race to show out 
deafness and blindness as never before. Even the children are getting blind and deaf. 
"The earth waxeth old as a garment." Those of us who changed radically our ideas of 
God began to have very acute hearing and wonderful clearness of vision far superior 
to the eyesight and hearing of our childhood. Then there began to be quickened 
another visual and another auditory power besides the regular.  
 

"Awake, O earth!" "Arise, shine, for thy light is come." "Awake! arise!" "Rise from 
the dead, and Christ shall give thee light." 
 

There are some new ideas going about the decrepit eye that everybody carried in his 
head; not an embryonic or crude eye, but an aged eye; aged as our other two eyes are 
getting to be in the race head. The true doctrine renews the strength of the aged; try 
the true doctrine. The true doctrine renews the vigor and vitality of those who are 
stepping over the lines into weakness; try the true doctrine. The new doctrine 
quickens that other seeing and hearing faculty within the already young and vigorous 
till they can see that other dimension in space which Jesus Christ saw so plainly. 
 

There are said to be people who can untie knots which the most skillful can not 
loosen, because by an unexplainable faculty they can do it. They use without knowing 
it, the fourth dimension in space. This quickened seeing faculty enables one to sit 
down and scan his own universe and set it into such order as he wishes it. You know, 
do you not, that any tangle in your affairs is the sign of incomplete knowledge? The 
true knowledge would untie the knot. There is one little link, one little point which 
would set everything right in a moment. So lovely and practical is the teaching of 
Jesus Christ that you cannot possibly miss knowing exactly what to do under all 
circumstances if you follow His directions. Do not be too proud to sit meekly down at 
His feet and learn about the fourth dimension in space. Learn the quickening words of 
our Father which He told us. He calls the word of  Truth "the Son." He urges us all to 
get free by the Son, or the word continually spoken. He was aware that if your 
hearing and sight are quickened by "the Son" or "the Word" there will be no going 
back. Mechanical appliances and material compounds are sure to lose their powers. 
So do the words of the strong human will or the mesmeric touch; but "if the Son make 
you free, ye are free indeed." He brings up Abraham to show that mere belief in 
physical descent is no healing or setting-free principle. 
 

It must be the quickening word of "the Son" in them, just as it was in Abraham, by 
which they shall be free. Unless they had that they were only children of the devil, or 
error, and would have the senile ear and eye, and tangle in affairs forever. Abraham 
was quickened by trusting in God supremely as the Only Spirit. Abraham called every 
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dream and every vision he had "a word of the Lord," till he got so ho was complete 
master over all things. "While people were wondering halting, doubting, Abraham 
was trusting God. 
 

These Jews knew nothing of such faith, and were therefore nowhere near being 
children of Faith. Just know that every single affair lies clearly soluble by a right 
word in the mind. Walk close to God with the words, "I and the Father are One. I tell 
you the Truth." Notice that the golden text of this lesson is the gist of it all. "As many 
as received Him, to them gave He power to become the sons of God." To receive 
Christ is to become the Christ through and through. The Christ is the Son of God. The 
Son of God has all power, has all knowledge. As you are well aware that you are 
children of God already, you know that this "becoming" simply means that you show 
forth your powers. 
 

There is nothing will pay you like the continual repetition of the words of Jesus 
Christ. You will soon be quickened through and through. There is the very power of 
God within you folded as a rosebud folds its petals and sepals and perfumes. His 
words will cause you to show forth your powers. What do you claim that you are? A 
little feeble child? Then you are drooping round with very limited powers. Do you 
claim to be a poor worm of the dust? Then you are prematurely old. Do you claim to 
be inferior in your nature to Jesus Christ? Then you are still wondering when the 
world will grow to love each other and do right by each other. Are you claiming that 
environments make you? Then you are an idolater, and subject to contagious and 
increasing liabilities to disease. 
 

Why don't you spring forth the potentiality of that nature with which you were vested 
before the days of Abraham? In other words, why don't you say: "I and the Father are 
One," "All power is given unto me," "I arise from my dream of error, I know my 
royal descent and my universal privileges, by my noblest word let mo be judged." 
 

This will cause you to make the atonement manifest. This will manifest your unity 
with the Christ. Unity with the Christ is marriage with the Holy Spirit. Union with the 
Holy Spirit is atonement. I will speak to you about the atonement next time. 
 

Meanwhile, quicken your powers—resurrect them into the sight of all the world by 
understanding this lesson as treating of your absolute freedom and absolute power in 
Spirit, and your nothingness and powerlessness as materiality. 
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Defy death. Defy pain. Defy weakness. Quicken--quicken into satisfactory living by 
true word. 
 

September 6, 1891.
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BIBLE LESSON 9 
 

INHERITANCE OF SIN 
 

This lesson of Christ and the blind man includes the whole Christian doctrine of 
salvation. It takes in the Christian teachings of all the Christians before the time of 
Jesus and since His time. Christ means truth, so all truth speaking is Christian 
teaching. Here in this lesson is the whole scheme of salvation by works, faith, and 
atonement. The pious Dervish and the modern churchman are trying to get into 
heaven by appeasing their deity with "works." But there is nothing heavenly about the 
lot or looks of either of these types of workers for salvation. It is only one side of the 
triangle of religious law. Incompleteness is always unsatisfactory. 
 

The trial at salvation from evil, by the practice of the mind called faith is also 
unsatisfactory as heretofore demonstrated. It is only another side of the triangle and is 
not complete doctrine. Jesus Christ preached "works", as, "If I do not the works of the 
Father believe Me not." "Have faith in God." "Have the faith of God." But He lived 
and demonstrated atonement or the unity of His mind with the mind that is God. "I 
and the Father are One." 
 

The effects of the practice of faith are remarkable, almost attracting one to study to 
have faith. There are two kinds of faith practiced, active and passive. An earnest 
young man gave all his fortune to the support of the poor, believing that his unseen 
God would provide for him. He charged nothing for arduous labors, verily believing 
in a sure sustenance, which, with all that belongs to human necessities, was actually 
provided always after intense assurances before his unseen God of his unshakable 
faith. A woman who had no faith but had been told what wonder might be wrought 
through faith sat down and deliberately determined to learn it. She sat down in the 
midst of her poverty and loneliness with her little children about her and practiced
leaning. She seemed shiftless to her neighbors, but it was astonishing what "luck"' 
that woman always had. Something good was always "turning up." Her children were 
all talented, beautiful, prosperous. 
 

Yet there was something lacking. Incompleteness is unsatisfactory. Neither the man 
or woman type pleased their neighbors by its demonstration well enough to practice 
it. Faith is a state of mind dependent on the will. Works may be quite external. Faith 
is mental. Atonement is the understanding and experience of the actual Oneness of 
the Spirit that is God; of the mind of man with the Mind that is God. 
 

This lesson teaches the whole doctrine of salvation according to Jesus Christ, as to his 
own duty and experience and the effect of such doctrine in toto upon all who receive 
it. He took a man "born blind" and healed him. Such blindness was considered 
incurable then as now by material methods. His disciples ask Him, "Who hath sinned, 
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this man or his parents?" What made them put the man before his parents in the 
matter of responsibility for that blindness? Why that was the much-talked-of doctrine 
of reincarnation, whereby a man was not considered new at the time of birth in the 
flesh, but old from having lived some previous existence and who now deliberately 
chose certain people for his parents to demonstrate prolonged existence by an 
experience with earth life. 
 

Jesus Christ promptly denied the whole theory, "Neither hath this man sinned." 
Whatever of eternal life the man as a sinless spiritual being might have realized, 
mortal ways were desired and the reincarnation of sin rejected. 
 

In Christian science we always recognize humanity as spiritual and deny the claim of 
sin in the individual and his ancestors just as Jesus Christ did. We do not believe in an 
inheritance of sin. "Neither hath this man sinned, nor his parents." We believe in an 
inheritance from God alone. "Hath not His hand fashioned me?" "Thou knowest that I 
am not wicked." "Call no man upon earth your Father." 
 

As it makes a mighty difference to our health what we believe, of course you can see 
that it is much better to believe that God is our Father than that any other being could 
hand us down an inheritance. It was a common belief in those days, as now, that we 
have what we have of disease and pain as a consequence of sin. 
 

But Jesus Christ, who told us to be sure and keep His words and be in a state of mind 
exactly like His, said, "Of all that Thou hast given Me, I have lost none save the son 
of perdition." "Son" means idea, speaking metaphysically, and since "the flesh 
profiteth nothing" we will not speak any other way. So "son of perdition" means idea 
of sin and its history. I drop no idea except the idea of sin; that I reject; for in a 
universe created by the Good, occupied by the Good, and tolerating only the Good, 
there is no reality in sin, so there is no place for sin. 
 

It will cause an appearance of blindness and deafness to hold the idea that there is any 
reality in evil of any kind. It is a limitation of powers and faculties. "I set before you 
an open door." There is universal freedom with ideas of universal Good. 
 

To keep the mind fixed to a prejudice has a limited effect upon some function of the 
body. This lesson is about dropping limitations and receiving light. Our missionaries 
to foreign lands ought to take their mind from looking at the natives through the idea 
that they are all to be damned if they don't know the history of the man Jesus of 
Nazareth. That idea has hidden the sight of their eyes and their children's eyes. They 
do not destroy the sight, but they hide it by an idea. 
 

Milton hid his eyesight by thinking the false idea that there was a Satan in Paradise. 
We hide our vision by trying to put limitations on our fellow men. 
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We see a man who says things of God in a laughing, hilarious fashion and we 
immediately think he ought to be hushed up, but how do we know but that he is a 
demonstration of the text, "The Lord laugheth in the heavens?" Man can do only one 
thing for his neighhor—give him his freedom. To throw around you an atmosphere of 
freedom will make men good—rather, give them a chance to show forth their inherent 
goodness. 
 

Keep hold of this idea of the righteousness of freedom and you will find other 
faculties of sight and hearing opening up. I do not mean intuition; I mean a present 
sight as definite as your sight of that bookmark and the page you wish to place it in. 
You have the hidden faculty of seeing what that missing link is, which, if you will 
look at it, will set your affairs right in an instant, cure the imbecile man at once, make 
a healthy artist of your consumptive daughter, and all such practical things. All these 
powers are natural, inherent, waiting to break forth as the morning. Only one door 
closes against them. That door is a false notion. Drop the false notion and the faculty 
is free in an instant, whether it is a hunch back, a short leg, or a congenital blindness. 
The saying, "I believe in universal freedom" will start you on the right road. 
 

The peculiarity of the blind man at the temple gate was his obedient spirit. There were 
throngs of blind men at those gates, but Jesus Christ saw that one who was willing to 
be the laughing stock of a city street by running through it with two clots of mud on 
his face in obedience to the command of the only mind that carried any possible hope 
in its tones. 
 

Obedience was his characteristic. They had told him that some of God's children must 
be beggars and he believed it. They told him he was blind, and he believed it. But he 
sprang like a bird from the snare of her fowlers when a loving heart said, "I deny 
these statements." 
 

As an idea that gets possession has such remarkable effects, you had better be careful 
to get the idea of unlimited Good. You had better be meek enough to obey this law 
even though it be broached to you by a Christian scientist. Obedience to principle in 
spite of the comments of your neighbors will do as marvelous things for you as for 
this blind man. 
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Martin Luther was of an obedient mind and so was chosen to be the reformer instead 
of the far abler Melanchthon. Melanchthon was more careful of "an intelligent public 
opinion." Saul of Tarsus was obedient to the highest ideal he realized and so was 

46



chosen to convert the gentiles and preach the Holy Spirit. Remember that the 
"intelligent public" is never a friend to the seeker for Truth till after it has "throughst 
him out," as the Jews did this blind man, and his cause has worked like leaven to gain 
the respect and love of the bold and fearless. 
 

Jesus here speaks of the necessity for works, or the significance they bear to the 
power of a man's doctrine. Such cases as this must not be going around, he said, "I 
must work the works of the Good." All healing by your doctrine is evidence of the 
spiritual power thereof. "While it is day," He said. He meant that span of duties laid in 
the pathway of all who are walking over this planet. Each one of us meets just such a 
set of affairs as we are perfectly capable of setting into right relations. We must not 
refuse any one of these duties. Do our highest best by every one of them, with no 
slighting of any task. Nothing is impossible. "As thy day is, so shall thy strength be." 
If you will take notice the greatest foe your mind has in its realm is the belief in 
limitation. It is sometimes called doubt. Jesus Christ said He would do His faith-
work, or show what an idea in faith would work, and then let their night-ways or 
doubt-ways deal with the world for a while. 
 

It has been these night-ways or doubt-reign since the crucifixion, but now the 
morning of understanding breaks. Health springs forth speedily. Our joy no man 
taketh from us. Christ has come again. We will not believe that there is any power in 
an evil idea. We do not believe that God intended or permits blindness, pain, poverty. 
These things are but the false teachings of men who have insisted, as Beecher did, 
that "suffering is a part of the divine idea." We hurl this lie from our mind, and lo, 
here is a new strength. Here is the ability to throw away our spectacles. They were 
only our externalization into works of our belief in suffering as part of God's plan. 
 

Jesus Christ made clay and anointed the eyes. He took this same old curative 
preparation and made it work to show how it was the difference in His state of mind 
from theirs. They had used it many times on this same man while they believed in the 
law of sin and death as part of God's plan. He knew better, and His state of mind took 
the same stuff and had a different effect. Everything you touch will be successful 
when you drop your "son of perdition," or idea of the badness of God. 
 

"Go wash," just as this blind man did; that is, deny or reject your old notions, "in the 
pool of Siloam," in the waters of pure Goodness. 
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You are by nature the lily of Siloam. If you speak these words you will prove it: "I 
drop my belief in the law of sin." 
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Then when the blind man saw, they "put him out." Of course, "in the world ye shall 
have tribulation." Put you are not expected to mix with the world. You are to triumph 
over every one of its beliefs by rejecting them, no matter if the greatest orators give 
them credence. "I am the light of the world." Any man who tells Truth is a light. Any 
man who announces a principle is a light. 
 

You must announce five things with great vehemence. These they are: 
 

God is the unending, changeless life of the universe.  
God is the undeniable, unchanging health of the universe.  
God is the unfailing, irresistible strength of the universe. 
God is the unfailing, ever present support of the universe.  
God is the immovable defense of the universe. 

 

These principles have not been announced till now. They have always been hidden by 
the words, "death, disease, weakness, poverty, danger." 
 

A word is a great thing. "For the lightest word there is account." Keep these last 
words out of your vocabulary in simple mercy. Wash clean in the holy Siloam of 
these words: 
 

"I do not believe in an inheritance of sin.  
I do not believe in the race experience of sin.  
I do not believe in the contagion of sin. 
I do not believe in myself as a sinner. 
I believe I am a child of God." 

 

"How sweet the lily grows." Now, you can deny blindness in the same washing 
words, can't you? Try it. No matter who taught you of an inheritance of failing vision, 
say, "I deny it." Do you remember the prophecy John made, that the "old dragon" 
should be destroyed in the last days by the testimony of the saints? The old dragon is 
the belief in sin. You are one of the saints to stand before the throne and shout your 
testimony. "I testify that I know that God is all, and in Him is no darkness of sin." 
After the testimony the man was received into union with Christ by thinking the same 
thoughts Christ thought. Think Plato's thoughts and get one cold mind with him. 
Think Aristotle and get away from home and honor with him. Think Jesus Christ and 
step into your Father's house. "Let the same mind be in you that was in Christ Jesus." 
How? Why, by thinking His thoughts. He made no mistakes.  
 

Leave Fenelon, a Kempis, and Guyon out of your ideals. They believed in the 
atonement by suffering. They were mistaken. There is no suffering whatsoever 
connected with marriage with the Spirit. Atonement is uniting or marriage. Be united 
to God only, the Holy Spirit. "Thy maker is thine husband." "I have set My Name 
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upon thee." "I have espoused thee." "The Spirit and the bride say, come." Fold 
yourself round with the glory of Truth till you do not see any evil in all your universe, 
for you have given that testimony which has destroyed it, or rather has caused the 
eternal day of God to break over. See, the dark corners of earth wait your testimony. 
 

Then thou shalt have no need of the sun, neither of the moon, to give light unto thee, 
for "The Lord shall be thy everlasting light, and the days of thy mourning are ended." 
Testimony will break down the middle walls of partition and be an open sesame into 
this fair kingdom that lies around us. People have hidden God's kingdom by 
accusations against Him. 
 

We make it visible by refusing to believe in those accusations. We take the words of 
Truth and are at one mind with God. "I and the Father are One." 
 

September 13, 1891.
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BIBLE LESSON 10 
 

THE REAL KINGDOM 
 

"He that entereth not by the door into the sheepfold—the same is a thief and a 
robber." 
 

The "sheepfold" is the kingdom of heaven. The kingdom of heaven is not a place, 
though the place where we are may seem heavenly. The real kingdom of heaven is the 
right state of mind. 
 

The right state of mind is where there is perfect health, perfect judgment, and perfect 
prosperity. These are all secured by right reasoning. The most exalted or freest 
reasoning gives the most exalted state of mind. If anybody stops short in his reasoning 
he stops short in his health and judgment; also in his prosperity. 
 

The only way to get into heaven or a perfect state of mind is to reason to the highest 
ultimates your mind can conceive without regarding whether it would be considered
reductio ad absurdum by the old-fashioned doctrines or not. 
 

As everybody is trying to get into the "sheepfold" here mentioned, let us consider "the 
door", or the doctrine taught by Jesus Christ so consistently that He called Himself 
"the Door." 
 

We may readily conceive of ourselves as so one with our doctrine, that we are it, if 
we have thought and taught and demonstrated it as Jesus Christ did His doctrine. 
 

"The sheep" are your thoughts. The calling of your thoughts "sheep" is very 
appropriate, because thoughts are docile and obedient like sheep. You yourself are the 
keeper of your thoughts and lead them where you will. 
 

Every obedient little idea has faithfully pictured that pink glow on your cheek, or that 
happy light in your eye. 
 

The thoughts referred to here are your thoughts of God particularly and what those 
thoughts do at all times. 
 

There is one thought you have which you have always held strongly and definitely or 
indifferently and indefinitely; it is the thought: "God is my friend." 
 

If you started this thought long ago and held it warmly and confidently, you are a 
good friend to everybody and you now number among your comrades one warm, 
strong, efficient, unchangeable, loving friend. There is another thought which is of the 
obedient character of the sheep here meant. It is the idea that "God is omnipotent." 
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This idea, held in confidence, has made you strong in yourself. The most obedient 
thoughts you have are your thoughts of God. Jesus when speaking of sheep refers 
entirely to ideas of God. It is ideas of God which if you shepherd well, will get you 
into that state of mind called heaven, when you have health, judgment, prosperity. 
Jesus Christ was sure that His doctrine was the door, and everybody else's the 
climbing in some other way. They had all before Him proved themselves thieves and 
robbers. Why? They had robbed men and women of health, judgment, and prosperity. 
Ninety years before Him there had ridden through the streets of Rome, Pompey, 
proclaimed conqueror of the whole world. Nine hundred cities, 1000 castles, sacked; 
long lines of manacled captives, with heads hung low and speechless tongues, 
sightless eyes, broken hearts. 
 

There was splendid triumph for Pompey and the nations shouted his greatness. But 
Jesus Christ said that was not the doctrine that would make heaven manifest on the 
earth. His doctrine was the only "door." His doctrine would bind up the broken-
hearted, loose the dumb tongues, unstop deaf ears, open blind eyes, lift up the cast 
down heads. Not only that, but all over the universe you might look for captivity 
where His doctrine had been preached (or His door opened) and you would not find 
captivity itself for He had "led captivity captive." 
 

Whoever has any bondage to anything whatsoever, believes more in Pompey's 
doctrine than in Jesus Christ's. For Pompey believed in bondage, but Jesus Christ 
believed in freedom. Jesus Christ was sure He had the only doctrine that would set 
absolutely free. A locksmith is sure he has the only combination that will open the 
safe. If another man has the same combination he can get in; otherwise not. Jesus 
Christ knew His doctrine to be the only door into safety. 
 

A mother had a baby that she loved so much she was like a barnacle to its little life. 
She felt ownership, clinging fondness for it. So the baby boy began to dwindle and 
pine away. Hungry love always drives its object away. If you long after and hunger 
for and eat with fondness in your affections the object of your affections will take 
every means to keep out of your way. So this little boy was getting away in self 
defense. No treatment helped the puny child till the mother said over and over in her 
heart: "You are God's child, you are God's child." 
 

She kept this up till she loosed the tentacles of her mind off his life, and he sprang 
forth as free and robust and hardy as a boy could be. This was the door or teaching of 
Jesus. "One is your Father, even God." 
 

Is not that teaching theft and robbery which takes away sight, hearing, hopes? 
 

Jesus Christ had nothing to say against Pompey as a child of God, but his expecting to 
enter into heaven by his beliefs was folly. Jesus explained that the porter at the door 
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of heaven is the Holy Spirit. The true doctrine will bring you face to face with the 
Holy Spirit who will lead you into greater and greater knowledge. The Holy Ghost 
will teach you all things—guide you into all truth. Just as soon as you take the 
doctrine of Jesus—actually take it—there is a fall of sweet, loving power over all 
thought. Once you spoke carelessly, "I believe in God as my friend," but now you 
speak it in delightful assurance that "whatsoever things ye ask for ye shall have." 
Every friend who comes to you, you know very well that they are the coming to you 
of your words about God. All truth about God brings good friends, good success. 
 

Jesus Christ praises Himself as His doctrine, and praises His doctrine as Himself. He 
lives in blissful ignorance that there is any idea that His doctrine and Himself are not 
God. When you praise yourself you begin to know yourself. Try it. Praise yourself 
silently at first, for you have not at first shown that your words are true by your 
works. Say, "I am wise. I am bold. I am good. I am able to do everything perfectly." 
You will soon show forth to all the world that you are indeed all this. Then you will 
have a beautiful effect upon the people. But, indeed— 
�
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Now try once speaking some of Jesus Christ's doctrine. He set before you an open 
door which no man can shut (or no prejudice or fear of anybody keep you from 
getting the benefit of). Let all your thoughts lie still as the pool of Bethesda for a little 
while. Now, if your mind is quite placid stir it with this beautiful text: "I am the 
resurrection and the life, he that believeth in Me though he were dead yet shall he live 
again." 
 

He had unbounded confidence in Himself. You must have unbounded confidence in 
yourself. Your Father is the same one that Jesus Christ had. Your substance is exactly 
like His substance. Your powers are exactly like His. You have the same privilege to 
ignore your birth in the flesh that He had. You can demonstrate over hardship, pain, 
trouble, as well as He if you have His combination, or doctrine, or "door." When you 
have got His teachings truly, you will not follow after strange doctrines. 
 

When you once have said "I do not believe in the power of evil to come nigh my life" 
and somebody tells you your house and children are burned, you will boldly say: "I 
do not believe it." 
 

Your calamities will turn out not calamities at all. The stronger you hold onto your 
words the nobler your blessings. After once saying: "Spirit is the only substance," 
nobody can make you believe that a whole tide of spirits exists. 
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After saying: "God is good: God is all," you would not credit the story of anybody 
who should say that in a vision he had a picture of hell. There would not be in your 
mind the slightest credence of the accuracy of that little girl's vision of Jesus Christ 
taking her by the hand to show her the sight of many people in hell. It would not be 
consistent with your knowledge of His saying that children's true thoughts always 
behold the good only. 
 

He said He came with a teaching that would give life more and more abundantly. A 
woman's beloved husband lay dying (according to other men's opinions.) She knew 
that according to Jesus Christ he had a right to more abundant life. So she leaned hard 
on some words of Jesus Christ. These were: "God is Love." She said them over and 
over and the air became vivified with Love. The man revived and lives, strong in 
God. 
 

A man who felt himself ignorant got down on his face on the mountain side night 
after night, saying to the folding presence of God: "Thou knowest all things." He 
repeated the words often. Repetition of truth is the quickening. After some days he 
became very wise. There was an extraordinary judgment and intelligence about the 
man. Whoever comes nearest to the principle of speech announced by Jesus Christ is 
really most successful in life. Life—such life as His words give is miraculous. His 
words are pure reasoning. Be careful not to stop short on your reasonings along His 
lines, for that is to stop short in health intelligence, prosperity. 
 

Right reasoning leads you on to the topless heights of the hills of God, from whence 
cometh our help. The most exalted reasoning concerning yourself as that substance 
and manifestation of God is the most exalted reward. Where have you stopped in your 
reasoning? There where you have stopped is where old age begins to seize you, pain 
lays hold, sickness settles. You have a right to rise to the hills of glory on the wings of 
the words of Jesus. Speak these words of His: "I am the root and the offspring of 
David, and the bright and morning star." 
 

See how hereby you announce yourself one with God in the beginning, now His 
manifestation by your word, and the shining glory of His goodness in the sight of all 
mankind. "Heaven and earth shall pass away, but My words shall not pass away." 
 

September 20, 1891
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BIBLE LESSON 11 
 

IN RETROSPECTION 
 

Today we are requested to make a definite review of the lessons of the last quarter, 
remind the Christian believer of his duty as a missionary of his doctrine, and speak 
for practical temperance in the conduct and speech of the human race. 
 

As one gets newer and newer ideas of a landscape by looking at it intently, so to look 
at a Bible text steadily, thinking it over carefully, we come to newer and newer 
revelations of its meanings. 
 

So a review of the lessons of the last quarter will give us new spiritual insights. 
 

Two ways of teaching the practice of divine principle have been in vogue; first, the 
statement of the whole doctrine in one short sentence, as in St. John, I., and then the 
particularization of that doctrine in living application, as in the statements following 
the first of John. The second method is the statement of particular cases and the 
explanation thereof according to universal principles, as a teacher might tell his pupil 
to take in, item by item, the views of his landscape and report the whole in the order 
of his survey. 
 

The method of John concerning the meaning of Jesus and His principle is to say that 
"In the beginning the Word was with God and the Word was God." 
 

God is the eternal Mind. Without Him was not anything made that was made. 
 

The thought of a mind is its word. As the Word that filled the Mind of God was God, 
of course the Word was equal in presence, power, and knowledge with Its Thinker, 
Whose Mind it absolutely occupied. 
 

And John taught that this Word made all that was made. 
 

Looking over the universe and seeing the earthquake swallowing its thousands, the 
tidal waves drowning cities, with the countless other manifestations of what does not 
coincide with this affirmation of John and Jesus and Moses—that all that the Word 
made was good—we find that an explanation of what they did indeed mean ia 
necessary. 
 

Nobody can make us call earthquakes and pestilences good. "Woe unto them that call 
evil good." 

Those who call calamity good always try to get away from it. 
 

The martyrs who did not try to get away from persecution had their minds so filled 
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with the name Jesus Christ that they did not notice what was going on around them. 
They did not explain that it was the absorption of their own mind with the name that 
gave them no room or space in mind for any other idea, that kept them from pain, but 
so it was. 
 

One whose mind is absolutely occupied by an idea has no room for a thought of pain. 
Now the Word that occupies the mind of God is God. And the creation of that Word 
is all good. 
 

Paul says there is a veil over the eyes of those who read the Scriptures about God. 
This is because people have accused God of creating both good and evil. 
 

"As I live, saith the Lord, I know the thoughts that I think towards you; thoughts of 
peace and not of evil." The word satan held in mind steadily would make all things 
dark and horrible and ugly toward us. We would finally conclude with Schopenhauer 
that God, the ruling force of the universe, is gigantic evil evolving into good. It would 
not make it true but would make everything hopelessly uncomfortable for us. 
 

On the contrary, the word God held in mind will fill all things with glory and a noble 
ecstasy for us. 
 
People have held in mind the words Holy Ghost, and the words Holy Spirit, till their 
mind was so renewed that their bodies were rejuvenated. 
 

People have urged holding the mind to the words "praise God," because so many men 
and women with tangled business affairs have straightened them out so satisfactorily 
by looking them straight in the face and saying, "Praise God." 
 

"With God all things are possible." The word God is the password into the kingdom 
of joy and gladness. God is Spirit. The word Spirit is the passport into substantial 
satisfaction. Not the word "spirits;" there are no spirits. There is one Spirit only—
God. 
 

John secondly bore record of Jesus Christ as the living demonstration of one who had 
held the word God in mind. He showed the way out of all the circumstances and 
conditions into which mankind has complicated itself by believing that God made evil 
as well as Good. 
 

There is no failure of knowing exactly what to do when the mind is set free and made 
true and joyous by the true thought of God. 
 

The Texas Compass plant always points truly north and south when it is not burdened 
with dust. Our judgment is perfectly true when one theme only occupies it. 
�
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John tells, thirdly, that what no one could ever accomplish by practicing any external 
science, or even by faith in the good presence of God, could be brought to pass 
instantly after the experience of the atonement—or at-oneness of the mind of man 
with the Mind that is God through thinking of God. 
 

Jesus Christ took the six stone water-pots, representing the six ugly situations of the 
human lot, and filled them with rich wine to symbolize how the homeliest lot can be 
made joyously satisfactory by our being united to God in mind. 
 

Jesus then explained to Nicodemus that the showing forth of the mind after it is sure 
of its oneness with God is so beautiful that it is like being born again. 
 

The process of systematic thinking to cleanse and quicken the mind is called in the 
science of mind denial and affirmation. We deny the reality of the principle of evil, 
and affirm the good only as a principle of action. 
 

John tells how Jesus taught His lesson of rest after labor by walking the long journey 
towards Jacob's well and resting thereon. Almost everyone has some goal toward 
which his efforts are made. If he has done his best and the end seems as far from 
attainment as at first he must give it up—rest. 
 

The time of discouragement and weariness and what seems failed hope is the time to 
give up and rest. Look for the sudden bloom of your hopes when you are willing to 
give up your hopes. 
 

The best and the highest powers and words spring forth after letting go with the mind. 
After His rest He announced Himself as the Messiah. He called Himself the Well of 
Living Water. All who speak truthfully of their spiritual nature are found to radiate a 
peculiar refreshment and healing. 
 

Take one who boldly announces himself as a believer in the unfailing bounty of God 
and you will find yourself suddenly devising wise ways and means for the 
management of your affairs while you are in his society. Take one who believes in 
God as his unfailing health and you will find in his society great impetus toward 
health. Take the one who announces that be believes in God as his unerring judgment 
and your own judgment will be nobler in his presence. 
 

"I will tell you, Socrates, a thing incredible, yet nevertheless true, I made a great 
proficiency when I associated with you, when I was in the same house, though not in 
the same room." 
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The next lesson was for the instructing of us all out of the habit of self-condemnation. 
Self-condemnation leads to condemnation by other people who find fault with us. 
 

We must take the good word into our mind that, "There is no condemnation." 
 

Seventhly, John taught how Jesus fed multitudes with small visible resources simply 
by giving thanks and praising the Spirit of God for the law of the self-increasing 
potency of every substance. Take the few pennies or the small revenues you are 
possessed of and do likewise and you will surely see the increase. 
 

Then John laid plainly before us that we must not believe in the necessity for hard 
work in order to live joyously. Also that we must give down our will into the Divine 
will by saying, "I came not to do mine own will," or else we would run our necks 
headstrong into great obligations and responsibilities. 
 

He showed in the tenth that what we see in others is the sight of some word in our 
own mind, and our eyesight depends upon how we see people, whether spiritually 
born or carnally born. 
 

Here also we discover the fact of the other seeing faculty once owned by the human 
race which now we are quickening again. 
 

In the eleventh we are told to deny reincarnation and the heredity of sin. 
 

Twelfthly he proves by the results of the teachings of Jesus we may see that His 
doctrine is the only door into satisfactory living. 
 

The lesson on missionary work shows that no matter if the Red Sea of difficulty 
seems to lie in our path, we are to preach the gospel we know to be true. 
 

The temperance lesson opened up to us the joyous information that no man ever 
wanted strong drink. He wants only strong words. When those are given the rum 
appetite is gone. Temperance means good judgment. Even children love good 
judgment. They naturally have it. But if somebody tells a child that he does not know 
what he is about, or fears all the time that he will do something wrong, his sweet, true 
judgment is hidden, and he goes seeking among tobaccos and cards for his hidden 
faculty. Whoever would set him free must praise the hidden judgment till it springs 
forth a glorious goodness; not for anything describe the poor judgment with which the 
Divine is covered. 
 

A child that is told of "spirits" loses judgment or rather has it hidden. There is only 
one Spirit. "Do not I fill heaven and earth?" To tell a drinker of ardent spirits there is 
but one Spirit, even though you tell him silently will "satisfy his soul in thought," 
while "describing his evil case" will be your accusing. 
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You remember that John the Revelator saw four angels (accusing words) given power 
to hurt the earth. 
 
But other angels sealed the servants of the Living God in their foreheads to keep them 
from the four accusations. 
 

The four accusations against God's people are that: First, they are liars; second, they 
are unsound; third, that they have wicked propensities, and, fourth, that they are made 
of a dying substance called mortality, if the beautiful temperance women would spend 
their generous energies speaking to and of the living goodness of the soul that the 
accusers have hidden, the goodness of mankind would break forth as the morning. 
 

"I, Jesus, have sent mine angel to testify that this is true." 
 

September 27th, 1891.
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by Napoleon Hill (and others) 

 
Of all of his works, none have ever matched his landmark The Law of Success in 
Sixteen Lessons. First published in 1928, these sixteen lessons became the world's 
first comprehensive philosophy of personal achievement. 
 
The Law of Success In Sixteen Lessons course by Naploeon Hill (who wrote the 
world's biggest selling personal development book - Think & Grow Rich) is in 
SIXTEEN separate ebooks totalling over 1000 pages!.  
 
Napoleon Hill designed and created The Law of Success as a study program 
consisting of 16 lessons.  It wasn't designed to just be read -- like a book.  It was 
meant to be studied and acted on -- like a course -- a course in success. 
 
We are including in this package the original, unabridged version of Napoleon 
Hill's all-time best seller, Think and Grow Rich, Charles Haanel's The Master Key 
System, Wallace Wattles' The Science of Getting Rich, F.W. Sears' How To 
Attract Success, Orison Swett Marden's Peace Power, and Plenty, and Julia 
Seton's The Science of Success. 
 
This package is a comprehensive course in self-development from some of the best 
teachers in this field that have ever lived. These combined eBooks could cost you 
upto $100 if purchased elsewhere on the internet, but now you can buy the 
complete set direct from the publishers for a special low price: 
 

22 eBooks in total for just $39.95! 
 

Click3Here to order now 
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Click4Here For Further Details 

 

   The Key-Books Collection of 50+ eBooks  
for just $47!    

Old Books Discovered that Unlock The 
Secrets of True Attainment, Personal 

Empowerment and Success 
. 

.  
 

The Key-Books Collection includes some of the very finest self-
improvement, personal growth, financial success, inspirational, 
motivational, self-help books ever written.  Some of the titles included in 
this outstanding personal success library are so rare that you probably 
would not find them in a bookstore if you spent all your life looking! 
They are published as Adobe PDF format eBooks that can be 
downloaded, saved, and read on your computer or printed out. They are 
suitable for both PC's and Mac's. 
   

... ..   

.. ..   
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Have you dreamed of a never-ending flow of 
money into your life?  Do you wish there was a 
way to be prosperous without a lot of hard (or 
boring) work?  Are you still struggling just to get 
by?  Would you like to learn the key secrets to 
attracting unlimited prosperity?  

Then today is your lucky day!  Today, you'll discover 
the secrets that wealthy people have refused to reveal 
to anyone.   

Once you learn these secrets and start using them in 
your life, you'll be able to create as much prosperity in 
your life as you want!  Can you imagine how fun and 
exciting it will be to have multiple streams of 

prosperity flowing effortlessly into your life, day after day after day?  With 
the information you'll learn here, you'll be able to accelerate your personal 
prosperity along any path you choose, and become as rich as you desire! 

Prosperity is about more than just being in the right business.  We all know 
people who are in the same businesses as rich people, but aren't getting much 
for their efforts.  For every successful inventor, there are thousands more trying 
to get their inventions noticed.  For every mega-successful author, there are tens 
of thousands of starving writers banging out words daily and never breaking into 
the big time.  And for every real-estate tycoon, there are thousands of would-be 
investors being buried by their properties.  No, it's not about what business 
you're in that counts. 

Prosperity is about more than simply having the right attitude.  How often have 
you listened to a motivational speaker say "It's your attitude that determines your 
altitude"?  If that were the case, then all you'd have to do is to think positively 
(they all stress Positive Mental Attitudes, right?) and you'll attract lots of money.  
But you and I both know that's not the case. 

Prosperity is about more than being in the right place at the right time.  If it were 
simply a matter of being in the right place at the right time, then it stands to 
reason that everyone would have an equal shot at making the big score.  But 
wealthy people consistently score big, over and over again.  Obviously, they 
know something that you don't. 

Click5Here For Further Details 
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